1/16/23, 1:12 PM Gmail - AW: Order No. 524410

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

AW: Order No. 524410

1 message

Lisa Becker - Mefina Medical <l.becker@mefina-medical.de> 16 January 2023 at 13:12
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

thank you very much for your message.

We have deposited the mentioned price in our order accordingly. Please send at the last mentioned
price. Thank you very much.

Best regards

Mefina Medical
i.A.

Lisa Becker
B.Sc., Kundenservice/Customer Service

Administration

Effiziente Losungen flir mehr Fortschritt und Sicherheit
Efficient solutions for greater progress and safety

Online: mefina-medical.de / medSim.de / aed-geréte.de

App: Service-App - einfach. direkt. komfortabel.

Durchwahl/direct number: +49 (0) 21 04 / 8 33 80 - 28

Mefina Medical GmbH & Co. KG,
Falkenberger Weg 42, D-40699 Erkrath, Germany
Zentrale/central number: +49 (0) 21 04/83380-0

Amtsgericht Wuppertal, HRA 23202 | Finanzamt Dusseldorf-Mettmann, USt-IdNr. DE815270630
Personlich haftende Gesellschafterin: Mefina Medical Verwaltungs-GmbH, Ringstr. 25, D-66506 Massweiler, Germany
Amtsgericht Zweibrticken, HRB 30586 | Geschaftsleitung: Felix Hither, Andreas Keller, Timo Wogias

Ist diese Mail nicht fir Sie bestimmt, so bitten wir um eine kurze Nachricht. AnschlieBend I6schen Sie bitte diese Mail,
einschlieBlich eventueller Anlagen. Vielen Dank fiur Ihre Mithilfe.
If you are not the correct addressee, please inform us that you have recieved this e-mail by mistake, and delete it.

We thank you for your support.

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Kate Griffiths
Gesendet: Montag, 16. Januar 2023 10:43

An: Lisa Becker - Mefina Medical <l.becker@mefina-medical.de>

Betreff: Re: Order No. 524410
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Good morning Lisa,

Thank you for your purchase order.

Please could | advise you that the price of part number 0111263 is €521.60 each,

Please let me know if you would like me to proceed.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Mon, 16 Jan 2023 at 09:00, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Lisa Becker - Mefina Medical <|.becker@mefina-medical.de>
Date: Mon, 16 Jan 2023 at 06:34

Subject: Order No. 524410

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir or madam,
Please find attached our purchase order.

Kind Regards

Mefina Medical

Lisa Becker

B.Sc., Administration & Customer Service

Effiziente L6sungen flir mehr Fortschritt und Sicherheit
Efficient solutions for greater progress and safety

Online: mefina-medical.de / medSim.de / aed-gerate.de

Durchwahl/direct number: +49 (0) 21 04 / 8 33 80 - 28

Mefina Medical GmbH & Co. KG
Falkenberger Weg 42, D-40699 Erkrath, Germany
Zentrale/central number: +49 (0) 2104 /833 80-0

Amtsgericht Wuppertal, HRA 23202 | Finanzamt Disseldorf-Mettmann, USt-IdNr. DE815270630

Persdnlich haftende Gesellschafterin: Mefina Medical Verwaltungs-GmbH, Ringstr. 25, D-66506 Massweiler, Germany
Amtsgericht Zweibriicken, HRB 30586 | Geschaftsleitung: Felix Hither, Andreas Keller, Timo Wogias

Rechtliche Hinweise und Datenschutz

Ist diese Mail nicht fur Sie bestimmt, so bitten wir um eine kurze Nachricht. AnschlieBend I6schen Sie bitte diese Mail,
einschlieBlich eventueller Anlagen. Vielen Dank fiur Ihre Mithilfe.

If your are not the correct addressee, please inform us that you have recieved this e-mail by mistake, and delete it.
We thank you for your support.
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