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M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

RE: Viamed Ltd has received the order RCBN400128764 dated 2023-01-03

1 message
Thornton, Fran <Fran.Thornton@york.nhs.uk> Mon, Jan 9, 2023 at 8:29 AM

To: "sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk" <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>, "Fryer, Duncan" <Duncan.Fryer@york.nhs.uk>
Cc: Payments YDH <Payments@york.nhs.uk>

Good morning Sophie

Please find attached amended PO. My colleague has confirmed that we do need part number 0110403 (MAX-3
Oxygen Sensor); therefore | have just adjusted the price to that which you advise below.

| trust that our colleagues in Payments will consider the accounts situation.
Thank you

Fran Thornton
Buyer
Telephone: 7712406

Acer House, Scarborough

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sophie Lines

Sent: 03 January 2023 12:20

To: Thornton, Fran <Fran.Thornton@YORK.NHS.UK>

Subject: Re: Viamed Ltd has received the order RCBN400128764 dated 2023-01-03

Dear Fran,
Thank you for your purchase order RCBN400128764.

Unfortunately, the price quoted on your order is incorrect. The current price breaks for part number 0110403 (MAX-3
Oxygen Sensor) are as follows:

1 unit - £80.00

2 units - £76.00
3-10 units - £72.00
11+ units - £68.00
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Unfortunately, we do not currently have these sensors available in stock, and furthermore, the above prices are only
valid until 6th February, where they are then due to increase. | would expect the lead time for the MAX-3 sensor to be
approximately 6 weeks.

An alternative sensor, which is available in stock and at a lower cost would be the R-48V (part number 0110048). The
price breaks are as follows:

1 unit - £42.00
2 units - £40.00
3-10 units - £38.00

11+ units - £36.00

If you would like to amend your order to the alternative sensor, please let me know.

*Please also note, York Hospital's account with us is currently on stop due to unpaid invoices, therefore we are unable
to dispatch any orders until this matter is resolved. Your accounts department will have been made aware of this,
however should you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, Jan 3, 2023 at 11:28 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: B2Brouter <noreply@b2brouter.com>
Date: Tue, 3 Jan 2023 at 11:16
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Subject: Viamed Ltd has received the order RCBN400128764 dated 2023-01-03
To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Viamed Ltd has received the order RCBN400128764 dated 2023-01-03.

View order

We are at your disposal

Find out how to get the most out of the platform by visiting us at B2Brouter.

How can we help?
Contact our support team.
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Invinet Sistemes S.L. Avinguda Diagonal 433, 1-1- 08036, Barcelona

E PO_300000002933135_RCBN400128764_2.pdf
63K
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