05/01/2023, 12:50 Gmail - Re: 788971

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Re: 788971

Jacqueline Morris (Housekeeping) <Jacqueline.Morris2@uhb.nhs.uk> 5 January 2023 at 12:49
To: "agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk" <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Aqgib,
yes the carriage price is fine with us this end , thank you

kind regards Jacqui

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Agib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 05 January 2023 11:38:04

To: Jacqueline Morris (Housekeeping)

Subject: Re: 788971

Hello Jacqueline

Good morning

Yes that is correct.

The carriage charge is for £10 for this order, could you please let me know if you agree so | can proceed.
Kind regards

Agib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1754186881888321326 &simpl=msg-f%3A1754186881888321326&mb=1 1/5
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 5 Jan 2023 at 11:21, Jacqueline Morris (Housekeeping) <Jacqueline.Morris2@uhb.nhs.uk> wrote:

Good morning again ,
just had a look at the order | placed and it was for the two different sizes of masks with a quantity of two packs each
with the carriage costs of £12.00 this was for all four packs to be delivered.

If you could confirm this is correct please

kind regards Jacqui Morris
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e @ http://finprodapps.heartofengland.nhs.uk:8010/0A_HTML/OAJsp?OAFunc=ICX_POR_REQMGMT_DETAIL&OASF=ICX_POR_REQMGMT_DETAlL&reqHeaderld=%7B!laEVP ~ O Search...

& Oracle iProcurement: Requi... % | [

ORACLE' iProcurement

Shop | Requisitions | Receiving | Contractors
Requisitions | Notifications | Approvals
Shop: Stores >  Requisition 1183854 >
Requisition 1181740

m Navigator ¥

B Favorites ¥ Shopping Cart Home Logout Preferences Help Diagnostics

Description neonatal phototherapy maskssize regular 1114005.carriage
price to be added on, i'll put it on the bottom of the order of
prem size Status  Approved
Created By MORRIS, Mrs JACQUELINE Change History No
Creation Date  30/11/2022 14:40:36 Urgent Requisition No
Deliver-To T51412 BHH CEDAR (OLD ASPEN) BIRMINGHAM HEARTLANDS Attachment None
HOSPITAL 45 BORDESLEY GREEN FAST BIRMINGHAM, West Note to Buyer
Midlands, B9 5TA
Justification
Details
Qty
Line Description Need-By Deliver-To Unit Quantity Delivered Canc
1 neonatal phototherapy masks size regular 1114005. carriage price to be added on, Tl put it on the 02/12/2022 11:00:00 T51412 BHH CEDAR Q&G (OLD EACH 2 0
bottom of the order of prem size ASPEN)
2  neonatal phototherapy masks size prem 111406 Carrige to be added onto the order amount of £12.00 02/12/2022 11:00:00 T51412 BHH CEDAR O&G (OLD EACH 2 0
with UPS ASPEN)
Return

About this Page  Privacy Statement

Shop Requisitions Receiving Contractors Shopping Cart Home Logout Preferences Help Diagnostics

Qty
elled

0

0

| Cancel Requisition | | Receive

Open Amount
Quantity Price (GBP) Details Order
2 48 GBP 96.00 @ /88971
2 46 GBP 92.00 @ /88971
Total 188.00

‘ Cancel Requisition I | Receive I

Copyright (c) 2006, Orade. All ightsreserved.

From: Jacqueline Morris (Housekeeping)

Sent: 05 January 2023 10:57:34
To: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Subject: Re: 788971

Good morning Aqib,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1754186881888321326&simpl=msg-f%3A1754186881888321326&mb=1
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Thank you for your email regarding the extra charges.
Sorry for my delayed response | have been off for the festive period and been trying to catch up
over the last couple.

| will get this delivery charge in process now for you

much appreciated Jacqui Morris

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Agib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 22 December 2022 12:08:46

To: Jacqueline Morris (Housekeeping)

Subject: 788971

Hello

Good afternoon

Thank you for your order, 788971.

I am currently processing this but need to make you aware there is a carriage of £10 for this order which is not mentioned on you purchase order or on your account.
Please let me know if you accept this carriage and would it also be helpful if | added a note to your account stating you accept any carriage charge up to £12?
Please let me know so | can proceed with the order.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
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Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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