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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Sensor for Oxyquant O2-Analizer
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 3 January 2023 at 13:14
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we send the client a proforma for 
1x  OOI103 Sensor for Oxiquant - 0110660 = GBP £72

GBP end user - will likely pay by credit card.

Thank you

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Beat Müller <btmueller@bluewin.ch>
Date: Fri, 30 Dec 2022 at 15:20
Subject: AW: Sensor for Oxyquant O2-Analizer
To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Ryan

I just need the sensor section (lower part) #ooI103 for GPB 72.

 

Kind regards

Beat

 

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Donnerstag, 29. Dezember 2022 15:08
An: Beat Müller <btmueller@bluewin.ch>
Betreff: Re: Sensor for Oxyquant O2-Analizer

 

Hi Beat

 

Thank you. Just to clarify, do you need the complete device or just the sensor section (lower part)?
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Complete Unit - 0111275 = GBP £155

 

OOI103 Sensor for Oxiquant - 0110660 = GBP 72

 

I have priced them both in GBP, as this will be a direct transition if you wish to pay by VISA card.

 

The prices above do not include any UK VAT. Once I have your reply we will send you a proforma invoice with the
delivery costs and then you can decide whether to send the payment by bank transfer or call us with your card
details.

 

I look forward to your reply.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Wed, 28 Dec 2022 at 19:04, Beat Müller <btmueller@bluewin.ch> wrote:

Good evening Ryan

Thanks for your reply. Delay is no problem, had enough to do with Christmas events…

OK I’d like to order ONE (1) lower part, containing the sensor for the price you indicated. I suppose that British VAT
is deducted because it’s export.

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:btmueller@bluewin.ch


03/01/2023, 14:22 Gmail - Fwd: Sensor for Oxyquant O2-Analizer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1754007294973099681%7Cmsg-f%3A175400729… 3/4

 

Let me know how I can pay (VISA? or via electronic bank transfer/SEPA?)

Do you send me a pro-forma invoice?

 

My full postal address is:

Beat Müller

Grossmattstr. 8

CH-8964 Rudolfstetten

Switzerland

 

 

Kind regards

Beat

 

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Mittwoch, 28. Dezember 2022 17:22
An: btmueller@bluewin.ch
Betreff: Re: Sensor for Oxyquant O2-Analizer

 

Dear Beat Müller

 

Thank you very much for your email and I apologise for the delay in our response.

 

In regards to the replacement sensor, you are correct.

 

We would be happy to supply you in Switzerland and we do not impose any minimum order requirements:

 

OxiQuant S - pn: 0111275 = GBP £155 /  EUR €168.00 each EXW

 

We also have a sister company that supplies devices for scuba market that may be of interest to you:
www.vandagraph.com

 

Please let me know if you have any further questions or if you would like to proceed with an order.

 

Kind regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Sun, 18 Dec 2022 at 15:26, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Beat Müller <btmueller@bluewin.ch>
Date: Sat, 17 Dec 2022 at 14:07
Subject: Sensor for Oxyquant O2-Analizer
To: <info@viamed.co.uk>

 

Dear Madam, dear Sir

Wem are interested in purchasing some sensors for the OxyQuant S O2 Analyzer from Envitec (s. attachment).
As far as we can see from the date sheet, the sensor (part #0110660)  is the complete lower part of the
analyzer.

So, do you export to Switzerland and if yes, what is the price  per pc and what is the minimum ordering volume?

 

Kind regards

Beat Müller

Swiss Cave Diving

8964 Rudolfstetten

Switzerland
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