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Michael Lamb <viamed.michael.lamb@gmail.com>

Fwd: Overdue Invoice
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 3 January 2023 at 13:20
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <thiago@underpressure.com.br>
Date: Mon, 2 Jan 2023 at 14:33
Subject: RES: Overdue Invoice
To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

 

Happy New Year for you, Family and all Vandagraph’s Time.

 

Please, send me a proforma invoice to 05 x R-17VAN

 

Thanks in advance,

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine
Enviada em: quarta-feira, 23 de novembro de 2022 12:08
Para: thiago@underpressure.com.br
Assunto: Re: Overdue Invoice

 

Hi Thiago

 

Thank you for your email.

 

9100-9212-2: We can supply our R-33VAN-2 = GBP £55 each EXW

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:thiago@underpressure.com.br
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:thiago@underpressure.com.br


03/01/2023, 14:04 Gmail - Fwd: Overdue Invoice

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2233dff547&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1754007676105443678&simpl=msg-f%3A1754007… 2/5

 

R-22S: we can supply our R-22VAN = GBP £35 each EXW

 

Goel 370: we can supply our R-17VAN = GBP £35 each EXW

 

Nuvair 9505: Unfortunately we do not currently supply a suitable replacement.

 

Citicel 7E/F: Unfortunately we do not currently supply a suitable replacement.

 

9212-9HSUBA: Unfortunately we do not currently supply a suitable replacement.

 

9100-1021: Unfortunately we do not currently supply a suitable replacement.

 

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Tue, 22 Nov 2022 at 20:26, <thiago@underpressure.com.br> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

 

Can you quote your similar items for these models below?
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De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine
Enviada em: sexta-feira, 29 de julho de 2022 05:18
Para: thiago@underpressure.com.br
Assunto: Re: Overdue Invoice

 

Thank you Thiago

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Thu, 28 Jul 2022 at 19:56, <thiago@underpressure.com.br> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

We sent today. Sorry to the delay.

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine
Enviada em: quinta-feira, 28 de julho de 2022 10:20
Para: Thiago - Under Pressure <thiago@underpressure.com.br>
Assunto: Re: Overdue Invoice

 

Dear Thiago

 

I hope you are well. We have still not received your payment.

 

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
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http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Wed, 13 Jul 2022 at 09:18, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

Thank you Thiago

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Tue, 12 Jul 2022 at 20:13, <thiago@underpressure.com.br> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

 

I’m sorry to this balance, I forget it.

 

I will send as soon as possible.

 

Regards,

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine
Enviada em: terça-feira, 12 de julho de 2022 08:36
Para: Thiago - Under Pressure <thiago@underpressure.com.br>
Assunto: Overdue Invoice

 

Dear Thiago

 

I hope you're well and keeping busy.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:thiago@underpressure.com.br
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:thiago@underpressure.com.br


03/01/2023, 14:04 Gmail - Fwd: Overdue Invoice

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2233dff547&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1754007676105443678&simpl=msg-f%3A1754007… 5/5

 

We have an overdue invoice awaiting payment. Please find your statement attached.

 

Please can you make the payment or let me know if there is a problem?

 

I will wait to hear from you.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

