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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Purchase order number D1/231222
1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 23 December 2022 at 12:17
Reply-To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
To: Oxylink - Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl>
Cc: orders@viamed.co.uk, Cathy Green <cathy.green@viamed.co.uk>

Thanks for the P.O. Piotr

It is a tight schedule, but we will try. 

Steve

On Fri, 23 Dec 2022 at 12:08, Oxylink - Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> wrote:
Dear Cathy, 

Please supply:

1.
Sensor type: R-22AVG HAIK OEM
Qty: x100

on order number D1/231222.

Please invoice and dispatch this order in the first week of February next week. This is another extra order apart
from the previous one for the same type of sensor.

Thank you!

Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa
Oxylink
Mobile: +48 509 701 509

--
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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