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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: oxygen sensors
1 message

Yeklef Mohamed <m.yeklef@yahoo.co.uk> 19 December 2022 at 11:31
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Good afternoon kate,

Thank you for update me on , so could you please send me proforma invoice including the shipping cost for  one item
(  0110021) & tow items from( 6850645 ).

I looking forward to hearing from you soon .

Kind regards,

Yeklef 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Sunday, December 18, 2022, 3:56 pm, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Yeklef,

Thank you for your email.

From our cross reference I can see that part number 0110021 - R-22MEDV is compatible with the
Vyaire SiPAP.  This costs $37.75 each EXW and is currently in stock.

Part number 6850645 is our part number 0110023 at $43.75 each EXW.  I can see from your email you
require two of these.

How many of the other part number - either 0110021 or 0110024 do you require?  I have attached a
specification sheet for part number 0110021.

We are having issues with part number 0110024 - R-24MED and I am unable to give even an
approximate lead time, though I can suggest an alternative. 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Sun, 18 Dec 2022 at 15:28, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: احسان الاشهب <ihsan.elashhab@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, 17 Dec 2022 at 07:11
Subject: Re: oxygen sensors
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

Please send us a PI with 2 pices of O2 sensors ( 6850645 ) for Drager equipment and (0110024 ) for
Vyair CPAP unit (picture attached).
Please confirm that the last part number is compatible with this CPAP machine.

Kind regards,
Ihsan Elashhab
Alhandasa Atobea
-----------------------------------------
Tripoli - Libya
Mobile: +218926070195
Email: ihsan.elashhab@gmail.com

On Mon, 12 Dec 2022, 1:28 p.m. Yeklef Mohamed, <m.yeklef@yahoo.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

Hope you are very well.

Actually, I am write to you on behalf of my friend his name Ihsan ( alhandasa Atobea ) he looking
for some items , so could you please send me an offer for 3 pcs of O2 sensors , Tow pcs of (
6850645 ) for Drager equipment & one piece of other attached picture where I hope to chosen the
an appropriate items number . 

I looking forward to hearing from you soon.

Regards,

Yeklef 
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