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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Order 13.12.
1 message

Jelena Doderovic <jelena@medisal.co.rs> 13 December 2022 at 17:23
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Cc: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate

You can send alternative. Thanks

Jelena

On 13. 12. 2022., at 17:36, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Jelena,

Thank you for your order.

I need to advise you that we are experiencing supply issues relating to part number 0110024 - R-
24MED.  We are unable to say when we will be able to supply these.  We have an alternative -
 0110049 - oxygen sensor R-49V which costs  $37.75 each.   This sensor is currently in stock. 
Would you like me to change your order to show 10 x  0110049?  I have attached a
specification sheet.

I have also attached a copy of your order (with the 0110024) to show prices, carriage would be
added at the time of invoice.  Please let me know if you would like me to change your order.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Tue, 13 Dec 2022 at 15:38, Jelena Doderovic <jelena@medisal.co.rs> wrote:

Dear Kate

 

Plese find below our new order.

 

Order 13.12.2022. One invoice    

      pcs

1 110022 O2 sensor R-22MED 10

2 110024 O2 sensor R24 10

3 110042 O2 sensor R42V 4

4 4310002 Flowsensor (pack of 5) 10

5 110023 O2 sensor R23V 10

6 1114017 Mask S- pack of 20 4

7 1114016 Mask M- pack of 20 6

 

Srdačan pozdrav/Kind regards

Jelena Doderović
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<0110049 Specification Datasheet ID17622.pdf>
<CVM140876.pdf>
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