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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Order for 1 x R21 AVG
1 message

Nick Greaves <nick@stargaragebingley.co.uk> 13 December 2022 at 12:55
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Kate I’m so sorry for delayed response. Please delete because the numbers didn’t correspond for the parts I ordered
the exact part elsewhere. No excuse thou so please accept my apologies. 
Regards Nick 

Sent from my iPhone

On 13 Dec 2022, at 10:37, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Nick,

I need to delete your order (confirmed order from above proforma invoice), but we can of course put a
new order on at any time.

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Tue, 1 Nov 2022 at 09:34, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Nick,

Please see attached proforma invoice as discussed with myself and Steve Hardaker yesterday.

Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.

mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk


13/12/2022, 13:15 Gmail - Re: Order for 1 x R21 AVG

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar2564584533521662280%7Cmsg-f%3A17521035… 2/2

If you are happy with it, please reply to this email and I can then change it to a confirmed order and
ask my colleague Cathy Green to contact you on 07973660840    for payment by card.  She can
also discuss collection from our warehouse with you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy

