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M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: ENQ/UNION/1500/22 CLOSING DATE: URGENT (08/12)

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 6 December 2022 at 16:11
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi

Please can we send Hasan a proforma for 5x MAX-250 (pn: 0110425) = USD $69.00 each EXW
Please include insurance, carriage and list the weight and dimensions.

| will answer the rest of the questions.

Thank you

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Info Union Medi Science <info@unionmediscience.com>
Date: Tue, 6 Dec 2022 at 13:57

Subject: Re: ENQ/UNION/1500/22 CLOSING DATE: URGENT (08/12)
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear,

Thank you for your email, please provide given below.
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1, validity of the offer.

2, expected delivery date.

3, HS code.

4, freight cost or approximate gross weight and cubic measurement.
5, manufacture name and country of origin.

6, valid ISO and CE certificates.

Thank you and best regards,

Hasan Albaqali
Business Development Manager
Office No. 13, Bldg. 2304, Road 2830, Block 428
S Al Seef District, Kingdom of Bahrain
URION TUEDISCIENGE = vo.: +o73 1755 1em0
B.S.C.CLOSED E-FAX NO.: +973 1791 @723
EMAIL: info@unionmediscience.com
SKYPE: union.mediscience

UNION MEDISCIENCE B.S.C. (c, WHATSAPP/VIBER/LINE/TALK: +973 3939 5921

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 05 December 2022 12:37

To: Info Union Medi Science <info@unionmediscience.com>

Subject: Re: ENQ/UNION/1500/22 CLOSING DATE: URGENT (08/12)

Dear Hasan

Thank you very much for your email.

The sensor you require is the MAX-250 (pn: 0110425) = USD $69.00 each EXW
Available from stock.

Unfortunately because of the current global situation, we are unable to guarantee the price for 180 days.
Please let me know if you are happy with the pricing of the sensor and we can look into the transportation costs for you.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
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VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 5 Dec 2022 at 07:53, Info Union Medi Science <info@unionmediscience.com> wrote:
Good morning, Ryan!

Good day, Greetings from Union MediScience. I hope this email finds you very well.

With the reference to the above subject, may we request to quote us your best competitive prices and to kindly read carefully the
terms and conditions of our client mentioned in our enquiry.

Please note that we need the HS Code in every item you will quote for National Health Regulatory Authority purposes.
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
SN Item Description UNIT QTY
1 VAPOTHERM OXYGEN SENSOR EACH 5

NOTE: MANUFACTURER: VAPOTHERM | MODEL: PRECISION FLOW | PART NO. R125P01-009

Your offer validity should be 180 days.

Catalogue number and catalogue copy of quoted item

Provide cost for country-of-origin certificate (legalized in embassy of Bahrain in the country of origin)
Provide the freight cost to Bahrain.

Provide the gross weight and cubic measurement of the goods.

Advise your best delivery time to Bahrain.

Shelf life/ Expiration of the item must be mentioned in the quotation.
Advise your best discounts as we are competing with others.

Confirm your offer quoted by CIF, C&F, FOB, or Ex-Work.

Confirm manufacturer name and country of origin of goods.

Provide HS Code number for the item offered.

Confirm if this Quotation is exclusively offer to us here in Bahrain
Please confirm that in case of order the following below will be provided
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e with order acknowledgement.

e QUALITY MANAGEMENT SYSTEM CERTIFICATES (ISO 9001, FSC) MUST BE VERIFIED

e QUALITY ASSURANCE CERTIFICATE (FDA, CE MARK, ISO 13485) MUST BE VERIFIED

e SFDA OR FREE SALE CERTIFICATE OR COMPETENT AUTHORITY MEDICAL DEVICE REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

Looking forward to receiving your valuable offer.

Thank you and best regards,

Hasan AlBaqali
Business Development Manager

Office No.13, Bldg. 2304 Road 2830, Block 428, Al Seef District, Kingdom of Bahrain
Tel. #:.4973 1755 1080 / E-Fax#: +973 1791 0729

Email: info@unionmediscience.com

Skype: union.mediscience

Whatsapp/Viber/Line/Talk: +973 3939 5921
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