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M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Confirm Order to Viamed

1 message
Kosal San <purchaser4@angkorhospital.org> 1 December 2022 at 09:40
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

Yes please wait to ship together is fine.

Many thanks
Kosal
as San Kosal
, ST, | o
Cov E Senior Purchasing Officer
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Read our 2020 Annual Report Telephone: (855) 089 806 388
(Telegram/WhatsApp)

angkorhospital.org

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Thursday, 1 December, 2022 4:35 PM

To: Kosal San <purchaser4@angkorhospital.org>

Subject: Re: Confirm Order to Viamed

Thank you for your reply Kosal.

Just to clarify, do you want to wait for the stock of 0110413 to become available before we ship anything at all?

We expect the stock to become available in 1-2 weeks.

Many thanks.
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Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 1 Dec 2022 at 02:05, Kosal San <purchaser4@angkorhospital.org> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Good morning to you.

Sorry for the late reply you since | was on my leave.

| think the good way to make shipment both together.
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You may update the available stock of 0110413 when come back?

Any question, please let us know soon.

Best regards,

Kosal
a5 San Kosal
, ST, | o
v ﬁ Senior Purchasing Officer
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Angkor Hospital for Children
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Read our 2020 Annual Report Telephone: (855) 089 806 388
(Telegram/WhatsApp)

angkorhospital.org

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Monday, 28 November, 2022 6:07 PM

To: Kosal San <purchaser4@angkorhospital.org>; Chhun sreypor <account4@angkorhospital.org>
Subject: Re: Confirm Order to Viamed

Good morning Kosal,

Thank you for your payment.

As you are aware, there will be a lead time for part number 0110413.

Would you like both orders to be shipped together and to wait for part number 0110413? Or we can ship both
orders together and ship 0110413 when it arrives - as you are arranging your own carriage.

| await your reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 28 Nov 2022 at 02:33, Kosal San <purchaser4@angkorhospital.org> wrote:

Dear Kate,

| hope this finds you well.

| just want to check with you if you have received the payment yet?

As my finance team Ms. Sreypor sent the email confirmation of payment last week .

Many thanks,

Kosal
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Friday, 18 November, 2022 4:28 PM

To: Kosal San <purchaser4@angkorhospital.org>

Subject: Re: Confirm Order to Viamed

Good morning Kosal,
Thank you for your purchase orders.
Please see attached updated proforma invoices.

MVM139977 may need to change - your PO did not mention what you had written:

| updated the proforma invoice to show the same as the PO.

| also updated the invoice addresses to be the same as delivery.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 18 Nov 2022 at 04:43, Kosal San <purchaser4@angkorhospital.org> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Hope you are going well.

On behalf of AHC, | would like to confirm order Goods from you now.

Please refer to the attached POs above for your reference.

You may prepare the new Pl which merge together for the advance payment asap.

Any questions, please contact us soon.

Kindly regards

Kosal

San Kosal

Senior Purchasing Officer

Angkor Hospital for Children
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Read our 2020 Annual Report

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1749807631449018957%7Cmsg-f%3A175100410...

Gmail - RE: Confirm Order to Viamed

Telephone: (855) 089 806 388
(Telegram/WhatsApp)

angkorhospital.org

717


https://angkorhospital.org/wp-content/uploads/2021/05/AHC_AnnualReport2020_KH_ENG.pdf?fbclid=IwAR2h9ulJKgY2-lbDq6k8gmAv3vTeKjyQQovMBXbgTzRfXOS0AeQUJ1K5QvY
http://angkorhospital.org/

