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M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: The new orders of R-24 Med and R-47V

1 message
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 29 November 2022 at 13:27
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Supattra Polnikorn <bb_bio_chem2010@yahoo.com>
Cc: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Dear Ponsorn Sengthan

Thank you very much for your email. We are currently having some supply issues with the R-24MED, but we can
supply the R-49V which is fully compatible.

R-49V - 0110049 = USD $37.75 each EXW
Please can you let us know if you would be happy for us to switch your proforma invoice to R-49V?
We will await your reply.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 29 Nov 2022 at 04:38, Supattra Polnikorn <bb_bio_chem2010@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan Swaine,

Would you please send me the proforma invoice of the items as below:
1. Viamed Oxygen Sensor R-47V 10ea.

2. Teledyne Oxygen Sensor R-24MED  20ea.

Would you please send invoice and ship to my address as below:

BB Bio-Chem Limited Partnership

68/522 Moo 8, Rattanathibet Road, Bangkrasor,

Muang, Nonthaburi, Thailand 11000

Mobile No.: +66-82-283-8995

Best regards,
Ponsorn Sengthan
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