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Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Medica - Flow Sensors

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Nov 28, 2022 at 3:26 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill
<janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi please can we set up a EUR distributor proforma account and send them a proforma invoice for 1x 4310003 =
EUR €39.00 (new pricing)

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Patricia González <patriciagonzalez@ibersurgical.com>

Date: Mon, 28 Nov 2022 at 13:35

Subject: RE: Medica - Flow Sensors

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Yolanda Sanchez <yolanda.ibersurgical@gmail.com>, <adrianasolano@ibersurgical.com>


Dear Ryan

 

Thanks for your email.

 

Our full datum are:

 

IBERSURGICAL,S.L.

VALLE DE LA BALLESTERA 64 BAJO

46015-VALENCIA

SPAIN

VAT NUMBER ESB46960795

 

WARE HOUSE ADRESS
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PEDIATRA JORGE COMIN, 11

46015-VALENCIA SPAIN

 

ACCOUNT DEPARTMENT             Esperanza Garcia

MANAGEMENT                                Yolanda Sanchez-resposable equipment división

PURCHASING                                    Elvira Alcala

 

If you need any aditional information please confirmed i tus

 

Best Regards and we wait your comments.

 

 

 

Patricia González

telf:96 348 81 96  - 

 

 

C/ Valle de la Ballestera, 64 Bj

46015 VALENCIA

www.ibersurgical.com

 

Piense en el medio ambiente antes de imprimir. Realmente necesita imprimir este correo? 

Please consider the environment - do you really need to print this email?

 

INFORMACIÓN BÁSICA SOBRE PROTECCIÓN DE DATOS PERSONALES

Responsable: IBERSURGICAL, S.L” B-46960795

Finalidad: Canalizar consultas y quejas planteadas.

Legitimación: Interés legítimo del responsable.

Destinatarios: Cesiones y/o transferencias a terceras empresas y/o organismos tal y como se indica en la información adicional.

Derechos: Acceso, rectificación, oposición, limitación, así como otros derechos debidamente recogidos en la información adicional.
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+ Información: Puede consultar información adicional al respecto a través del siguiente enlace www.procoden.es/B46960795

CLÁUSULA DE CONFIDENCIALIDAD

Este mensaje y los archivos adjuntos son confidenciales y se dirigen exclusivamente a su destinatario. Si Ud. no es el destinatario indicado,
queda advertido de que la utilización, divulgación y/o copia sin autorización está prohibida en virtud de la legislación vigente. Si usted ha
recibido este correo por error, por favor avísenos inmediatamente a través de  correo electrónico  o por teléfono, descritos en la parte superior,
y tenga la amabilidad de eliminarlo de su sistema.

 
 

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: lunes, 28 de noviembre de 2022 13:27

Para: Patricia González <patriciagonzalez@ibersurgical.com>

CC: Yolanda Sanchez <yolanda.ibersurgical@gmail.com>; adrianasolano@ibersurgical.com

Asunto: Re: Medica - Flow Sensors

 

Hi Patricia

 

We don't have a datasheet, but please find the IFU attached, it has a little bit more technical information.

 

EAN code: 24251679601566

 

Please can you send us your complete delivery and invoice address, so we can set you up on the system.

Please can you provide names and contact information for those responsible for accounts, management and
purchasing.

 

As soon as we have this information, we can send you a proforma invoice for the 1x box.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Mon, 28 Nov 2022 at 12:01, Patricia González <patriciagonzalez@ibersurgical.com> wrote:
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Dear Ryan

 

                Thanks for your email.

 

Please Could you sent us a datasheet of product, EAN Code of product etc?

 

We need this information for selling here.

 

We want to pass an order of one box for samples at Customer. Could you confirmed the manner to proceed?

 

Best regards

 

Patricia González

telf:96 348 81 96  - 

 

 

C/ Valle de la Ballestera, 64 Bj

46015 VALENCIA

www.ibersurgical.com

 

Piense en el medio ambiente antes de imprimir. Realmente necesita imprimir este correo? 

Please consider the environment - do you really need to print this email?

 

INFORMACIÓN BÁSICA SOBRE PROTECCIÓN DE DATOS PERSONALES

Responsable: IBERSURGICAL, S.L” B-46960795

Finalidad: Canalizar consultas y quejas planteadas.

Legitimación: Interés legítimo del responsable.

Destinatarios: Cesiones y/o transferencias a terceras empresas y/o organismos tal y como se indica en la información adicional.

Derechos: Acceso, rectificación, oposición, limitación, así como otros derechos debidamente recogidos en la información adicional.

+ Información: Puede consultar información adicional al respecto a través del siguiente enlace www.procoden.es/B46960795
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CLÁUSULA DE CONFIDENCIALIDAD

Este mensaje y los archivos adjuntos son confidenciales y se dirigen exclusivamente a su destinatario. Si Ud. no es el destinatario indicado,
queda advertido de que la utilización, divulgación y/o copia sin autorización está prohibida en virtud de la legislación vigente. Si usted ha
recibido este correo por error, por favor avísenos inmediatamente a través de    correo electrónico   o por teléfono, descritos en la parte
superior, y tenga la amabilidad de eliminarlo de su sistema.

 
 

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: lunes, 28 de noviembre de 2022 10:29

Para: Yolanda Sanchez <yolanda.ibersurgical@gmail.com>

CC: Pachi Gonzalez Iber <patriciagonzalez@ibersurgical.com>; adrianasolano@ibersurgical.com

Asunto: Re: Medica - Flow Sensors

 

Dear Yolanda

 

Thank you, I look forward to your reply.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 




Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Mon, 28 Nov 2022 at 08:30, Yolanda Sanchez <yolanda.ibersurgical@gmail.com> wrote:

﻿Dear Ryan,

 

 

Thank you for the information. It’s true that we’re interested in the flow sensors for Hamilton.  

 

Let’s see the situation in our area and tell you about the distribution. 
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Best Regards.  

 

 

Yolanda Sánchez. 

 649401238 

 

 

Ibersurgical, S.L.

C/ Valle de la Ballestera 64 bajo

46015 Valencia

Tel. 96 348 51 74

 

INFORMACIÓN BÁSICA SOBRE PROTECCIÓN DE DATOS PERSONALES



Responsable: IBERSURGICAL, S.L" B-46960795



Finalidad: Canalizar consultas y quejas planteadas.



Legitimación: Interés legítimo del responsable.



Destinatarios: Cesiones y/o transferencias a terceras empresas y/o

organismos tal y como se indica en la información adicional.



Derechos: Acceso, rectificación, oposición, limitación, así como otros

derechos debidamente recogidos en la información adicional.



+ Información: Puede consultar información adicional al respecto a través

del siguiente enlace  <http://www.procoden.es/B46960795>

www.procoden.es/B46960795



CLÁUSULA DE CONFIDENCIALIDAD



Este mensaje y los archivos adjuntos son confidenciales y se dirigen

exclusivamente a su destinatario. Si Ud. no es el destinatario indicado,

queda advertido de que la utilización, divulgación y/o copia sin

autorización está prohibida en virtud de la legislación vigente. Si usted ha

recibido este correo por error, por favor avísenos inmediatamente a través

de  correo electrónico  o por teléfono, descritos en la parte superior, y

tenga la amabilidad de eliminarlo de su sistema. 

 

El 25 nov 2022, a las 16:22, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> escribió:

﻿

Dear Yolanda

 

Thank you very much for taking the time to visit our stand at Medica.

 

I understand from my colleague that you are interested in our Hamilton compatible flow sensors
and I can confirm that we do not currently have any representation for this item in Spain, so we
would be very interested in the prospect of working with you.

 

Please find our leaflet attached and I have listed our distributor pricing below:
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Flowsensor H = EUR €39 / box of 6 sensor EXW

 

I look forward to hearing from you and please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any
questions.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 




Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
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