28/11/2022, 11:40 Gmail - Fwd: Viamed - Oxygen Sensors

M Gma|l Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: Viamed - Oxygen Sensors

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 28 November 2022 at 11:28

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Please can we send Adnan at Saim Medical a proforma invoice for the following items:

20x OOM204 - 0110582 = USD $69.00

10x OOM201 - 0110580 = USD $43.75

15x OOM102 - 0110571 = USD $32.50

20x Viamed R-30V, manufactured by Envitec - 0110040 = USD $70.00

Carriage by Parcel Force - Global Priority = USD $145.65 (original quote attached, please attach to order)
Sensors to be bulk packed.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, 28 Nov 2022 at 11:22

Subject: Re: Viamed - Oxygen Sensors

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan
Yes i m agree for this global express

Adnan

On Mon, Nov 28, 2022, 4:19 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Our warehouse does not use parcel force, so they would not obtain a quote, this is something | have to do and having just returned from Medica, | have been
extremely busy.

The cost of delivery from parcel force would be approximately USD $145.65 for global priority service. Would this be acceptable? If so, we will prepare the proforma
invoice.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 28 Nov 2022 at 05:47, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
i think you are not interested to send proforma invoice
Adnan

On Fri, Nov 25, 2022, 4:17 PM Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
reminder

On Fri, Nov 25, 2022, 12:45 PM Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Reminder

On Thu, Nov 24, 2022, 9:02 PM Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
we are waiting kindly tomorrow share proforma invoice with EMS courier freight

adnan

On Thu, Nov 24, 2022, 8:16 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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