24/11/2022, 15:03 Gmail - Fwd: Teledyne R-17A Oxygen Sensor

M Gma” Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: Teledyne R-17A Oxygen Sensor

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 24 November 2022 at 13:03
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we set this company up on the system and send them a proforma invoice for 30x R-17A sensors. EUR
distributor pricing.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Marko Muza <marko.muza@cvh.hr>

Date: Thu, 24 Nov 2022 at 11:13

Subject: RE: Teledyne R-17A Oxygen Sensor

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Stanislav Krsnik <stanislav.krsnik@cvh.hr>

Dear sir, you can send me invoice for 30 pieces.

We will make the payment immediately after we recieve the offer.
Our company informations is :

Centar za vozila Hrvatske d.d.

Capraska 6

10000 Zagreb, Croatia

OIB : 73294314024

Include delivery in the offer and specify the delivery date.

Please form the offer for payment by bank transfer or Internet banking.

Best regards,
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Marko Muza, mag. oec.

Struéni referent za prodaju i nabavu

Odjel za materijalno-financijske poslove
Centar za vozila Hrvatske d.d.

Zagreb, Capraska 6

Tel: 01/4802-429
e-mail: marko.muza@cvh.hr

Mob: 099 83 50 954

AN

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, November 24, 2022 11:41 AM

To: Marko Muza <marko.muza@cvh.hr>

Cc: Stanislav Krsnik <stanislav.krsnik@cvh.hr>

Subject: Re: Teledyne R-17A Oxygen Sensor

Dear Marko

We have the stock available, so we would arrange dispatch as soon as payment is received against a proforma
invoice. We use UPS for transport, but you can make your own transport arrangements if you would prefer.

Please let me know the details if you would like to proceed and | will send you a proforma invoice with the total costs
including delivery.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
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On Thu, 24 Nov 2022 at 10:13, Marko Muza <marko.muza@cvh.hr> wrote:
Dear,

Can you please specify the delivery date?

Best regards,

Marko Muza, mag. oec.

Struc¢ni referent za prodaju i nabavu

Odjel za materijalno-financijske poslove
Centar za vozila Hrvatske d.d.

Zagreb, Capraska 6

Mob: 099 83 50 954

E-mail: marko.muza@cvh.hr

24.11.2022., u 11:09, korisnik Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> je napisao:

Hi

We have some sensors available from stock, we would ask for prepayment and then send the order
as soon as payment is received. If you are planning to proceed with an order, please can you confirm
the quantity you would require and | will check availability?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117
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On Thu, 24 Nov 2022 at 09:55, Stanislav Krsnik <stanislav.krsnik@cvh.hr> wrote:

Markec pitaj ih kad bi mogli dobiti robu?

Lp,
Stanko

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, November 24, 2022 10:50 AM

To: Marko MuzZa <marko.muza@cvh.hr>

Cc: Stanislav Krsnik <stanislav.krsnik@cvh.hr>

Subject: Teledyne R-17A Oxygen Sensor

Dear Marko

Please accept my email, as we represent Teledyne's automotive range outside of the USA.

Please find some information attached and our distributor pricing for the R-17A below:

100+ =€
27.40 each
EXW

Euro 1+ =€38.80 10+=€33.20 25+=€31.00 50+ =€ 29.10
Distributor each EXW each EXW each EXW each EXW

We currently have stock available from our UK warehouse.

If you would like to proceed with an order, please supply your complete delivery/invoice details,
contact for your accounts, management and purchasing and your company EORI/VAT numbers.

I look forward to your feedback and | welcome any questions you may have.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk
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