
23/11/2022, 15:22 Gmail - Fwd: Order

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1750298485163617273%7Cmsg-f%3A175029848… 1/2

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 23 November 2022 at 14:44
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Perfusion <mpp@manperfusion.co.uk>

Date: Wed, 23 Nov 2022 at 14:43

Subject: Order

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>


Hello

 

I would like to place the following order:

 

Purchase Order no: MDR/50052

8 x Teledyne Oxygen Sensor R-17MED @ £38.00 per unit

Invoice & Delivery Address:

Manchester Perfusion Practice Ltd, 12d Woodford Road, Bramhall, Cheshire, SK7 1JJ

 

Please let me know if you have any queries.

 

Kind regards

 

Denise

 

Denise Reid

Office Manager

Mobile 07734 385034

Office 0161 491 5797

 

MPP Ltd / Haemoclaim

12d Woodford Road

Bramhall

Cheshire

SK7 1JJ
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Websites:

www.manchesterperfusion.com

www.haemoclaim.com
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