
23/11/2022, 10:54 Gmail - AW: PO 21442

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1750274427599283995%7Cmsg-f%3A175028065… 1/3

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

AW: PO 21442

1 message

Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de> 23 November 2022 at 10:01
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate,

 

has there been a price raise? Last price you told me was 59,20 €.

 

But ok, you can proceed with the PO and let me know the lead time.

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen/with best regards

 

Christopher Kramp

Einkauf / Purchasing manager

 

***Achtung – neue Anschrift für Lieferscheine und Rechnungen***

 

Ab dem 08.08.2022 finden Sie uns unter unserer neuen Anschrift / Please note our new address:

 

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 107-109

23568 Lübeck

+49 451 80 90 4 - 120 fon

+49 451 80 90 4 - 111 fax

www.DEHAS.de

Geschäftsführung DEHAS :  J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.:  DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschützte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtümlich erhalten
haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser E-Mail ist nicht
gestattet. 

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden

 

 

Von: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Kate Griffiths

Gesendet: Mittwoch, 23. November 2022 10:54
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An: Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de>

Betreff: Re: PO 21442

 

Good morning,

 

Thank you for your order.

 

I will send a proforma invoice to you, I just need to let you know that the price of part number 3210073 and 3210074
is 71 euros each.  Are you happy got me to proceed with that price please?

 

I also need to let you know that we do not have enough stock of the above items, so we would let you know a lead
time if you choose to proceed/upon receipt of payment.

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 23 Nov 2022 at 08:22, Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de> wrote:

 

mailto:purchasing@dehas.de

