22/11/2022, 11:39 Gmail - Re: Oxygen Cell Budget

M Gma“ Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: Budget Oxygen Cell

1 message

Sabrina Pilon Canal Scodino <adm@cardiodiagnostico.med.br> Mon, Nov 21, 2022 at 6:44 PM

To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Good afternoon,
It would be possible to change to 02 UFO 130-2 Oxygen Sensor units, for delivery and shipping as follows:
RECIPIENT: RAFAEL ALTOE CHAGAS
CPF: 115.421.267-03
Address: RUA PROFESSOR AUGUSTO RUSCHI, 600, PRAIA DE ITAPARICA - VILA VELHA - ES - BRAZIL - CEP
29.102-080
How much payment could be via PayPal?

Yours sincerely,

N MDIO Sabrina P. Canal Scodino
AGNO Gerente Administrativo
AGNOSTICO  (57)3421-5224

On Mon, Nov. 21. On 2022 at 1:31 pm, Sophie Lines < office@viamed.co.uk > wrote:
Good afternoon,

Thank you for your reply. Please find attached your Proforma Invoice for 1x UFO 130-2 Oxygen Sensor as
requested.

Please can you check | have your address details written correctly on this document? If you would like to proceed,
our bank details can be found at the bottom of the Proforma.

If you have any questions please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards
Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office

will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Email Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
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may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, Nov 21, 2022 at 2:03 PM Sabrina Pilon Canal Scodino < adm@cardiodiagnostico.med.br > wrote:
Good Morning,

Please send us a proforma invoice with 1x 0110081 UFO 130-2 Oxygen Sensor to get an idea of the shipping
cost.

Yours sincerely,

CA.RDIO Sabrina P. Canal Scodino
. OSTICO Gerente Administrativo
IIAGNOSTICO (57) 3421-5224

Classification of information:

() Confidential ( ) Restricted ( ) Internal Use (') Public

Prezado (a), a Cardiodiagndstico Servigos Médicos Ltda valoriza a privacidade e protegédo dos seus dados, em
conformidade com a Lei Geral de Protegéo de Dados Pessoais (13.709/18). Portanto, os dados deste e-mail
ficardo mantidos em nossos bancos de dados pelo periodo de 10 (dez) anos, para eventuais consultas. Os seus
dados nao serdo compartilhados com nenhum outro controlador ou operador e, apds o periodo acima citado,
serdo excluidos de nossos bancos de dados, conforme politica de descarte de dados. A qualquer momento, o
titular podera solicitar a exclusao dos seus dados, via canal de Privacidade e Protegdo de Dados. Qualquer
duvida, procure o canal de Privacidade e Protegao de Dados e comunique ao encarregado de dados pelo e-

mail: dpo@cardiodiagnostico.med.br . Esta mensagem pode conter informagdes confidenciais e/ou privilegiadas.

Se vocé nao for o destinatario ou a pessoa autorizada a receber esta mensagem, néo deve usar, copiar ou
divulgar as informacdes nela contida ou tomar qualquer agéo baseada nessas informagdes. Se vocé recebeu
essa comunicagao por engano, por favor nos avise imediatamente, respondendo a mensagem e excluindo-a do
seu computador.

Em seg., 21 de nov. de 2022 as 10:47, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> escreveu:
Good afternoon,

Thank you for your email.

| can confirm we supply the UFO 130-2 Oxygen sensor - our part number is 0110081 - the prices are as
follows:

1 unit - $187.85

2 units - $169.07

3-10 units - $159.67

11+ units - $150.28

Unfortunately, we do not supply the tubing mentioned in your email.

If you would like me to send you a Proforma Invoice for 1x 0110081 UFO 130-2 Oxygen Sensor, with shipping
costs to Brazil, please let me know.
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Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main
office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited
and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or
call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Good afternoon,

| request a quote for 01 oxygen cell (product code 0110081) (photo attached) and 01 air line (photo
attached).

For use on equipment: Respiratory Gas Analyzer/Metalyzer 3B

Serial Number: ML349810906

Owner: CARDIODIAGNOSTICO SERVICOS MEDICOS LTDA

CNPJ: 36.041.168/0001-92

ADDRESS: Rua Professor Augusto Ruschi, 600, Praia de Itaparica - Vila Velha - ES - Brazil
CEP: 29102-080

Yours sincerely,

SABRINA CANAL
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