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Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM138167-1


helen lamb <office@viamed.co.uk> 22 November 2022 at 09:34
Reply-To: helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk
To: janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: James Gough <no1calibrations@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, 22 Nov 2022, 08:44

Subject: Re: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM138167-1

To: <accounts@viamed.co.uk>


Hello


We are looking to reorder the same product & quantity which appear on

the attached previous invoice.

Could you please confirm current price by sending proforma invoice.

Many thanks for your help


Sandy


No1 Calibrations

James Gough  - Engineer  07981 165 888

Sandy Gough  - Accounts  07974 115 990


no1calibrations@gmail.com


On Tue, Jul 19, 2022 at 10:26 AM <accounts@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

>

> Please find attached invoice(s) from Viamed Ltd.

>

> Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us.

> accounts@viamed.co.uk

>

>

>

>

> Regards

> Accounts Department

> Viamed Ltd

> accounts@viamed.co.uk

>

> Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.
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