21/11/2022, 11:13 Gmail - RE: TOF 3d - Broadoak Unit

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: TOF 3d - Broadoak Unit

1 message
Pauline Bonney <Pauline.Bonney@merseycare.nhs.uk> 21 November 2022 at 11:05

To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Stephen Halsall <stephen.halsall@merseycare.nhs.uk>, Marie Woods <Marie.Woods@merseycare.nhs.uk>

Hello Kate

Purchase Order No. 345041860 for the above quotation.

Can you please change postcode for delivery to the Broadoak Unit to L14 3PJ.

| have attached a letter for suppliers for payment of invoices. Where to send to etc. for your
information.

Thanks.

Regards

Pauline Bonney

Secretary

Health & Wellbeing / Neuromodulation Clinics
Broadoak Unit, L14 3PJ

Tel: 0151 5078/5098

Pauline.bonney@merseycare.nhs.uk

From: Pauline Bonney <Pauline.Bonney@merseycare.nhs.uk>
Sent: 03 November 2022 10:34

To: Pauline Bonney <Pauline.Bonney@merseycare.nhs.uk>
Subject: FW: TOF 3d
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Regards

Pauline Bonney

Secretary

Health & Wellbeing / Neuromodulation Clinics
Broadoak Unit, L14 3PJ

Tel: 0151 5078/5098

Pauline.bonney@merseycare.nhs.uk

From: Stephen Halsall <stephen.halsall@merseycare.nhs.uk>
Sent: 31 October 2022 10:27

To: Pauline Bonney <Pauline.Bonney@merseycare.nhs.uk>
Subject: FW: TOF 3d

Hi Pauline, can we order this please.

Regards S

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Giriffiths
Sent: 27 October 2022 16:51

To: Stephen Halsall <stephen.halsall@merseycare.nhs.uk>

Subject: Re: TOF 3d

Good afternoon Stephen,

Thank you for your reply.

Please see attached quotation as requested. Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.
Alternatively, any changes such as addresses, PO number etc can be made upon receipt of a purchase order,
should you wish to proceed.

The quotation is valid for 30 days only.

Many thanks.
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Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 27 Oct 2022 at 15:16, Stephen Halsall <stephen.halsall@merseycare.nhs.uk> wrote:
Hi Kate,

Can you please provide me with a quotation with reference /order number for the following

2510091,
2510105,
2520110,
2520111,
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Please make the it out to the
Mersey Care NHS foundation Trust
Neuromodulation service,
Broadoak Unit,

West Road.

Broadgreen hospital site.
Broadgreen

Liverpool.

L14 3PJ.

Regards Stephen

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 27 October 2022 13:21

To: Stephen Halsall <stephen.halsall@merseycare.nhs.uk>

Subject: Re: TOF 3d

Good afternoon Stephen,

The price breaks for part number 0110040 - R-30V are as follows:

1=£54.00 2 =£51.30each 3-10 =£ 48.60 each 11 or more = £ 45.90 each

Carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors and all prices are excluding VAT.

This item is currently in stock.

| have replied to your TOF 3d enquiry in a separate email.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 27 Oct 2022 at 13:07, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Stephen Halsall <stephen.halsall@merseycare.nhs.uk>
Date: Thu, 27 Oct 2022 at 13:04

Subject: RE: TOF 3d

To: Catrin Hollings <office@yviamed.co.uk>

Sorry could you quote for 2 oxygen sensors for a Datex ohmenda S/5 Aespire anaesthetic
machine.
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| have had these from yourselves in the past.

Regards Stephen

From: Stephen Halsall

Sent: 27 October 2022 13:00

To: Catrin Hollings <office@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: TOF 3d

Hi Catrin, can to you please give me a quote for the TOF 3d, top spec and sundries.

This is a quote to buy so | would appreciate your best price, please.

Regards

Stephen Halsall

Neuromodulation Service Clinical Nurse Lead

Office: +44 (0)151 250 5055

Email: Stephen.halsall@merseycare.nhs.uk

TMS Services
Broadoak Unit
Merseycare NHS Trust
Broadgreen Hospital Site
Thomas Drive

Liverpool

L14 3PJ

2 attachments

@ QVM139999.docx
1766K

@ Supplier Letter (SBS).docx
65K
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