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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: New order 7

1 message

Justyna Komańska <import@resculine.pl> 18 November 2022 at 13:44
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hello Kate,

 

It happends.  No worries.

 

I don’t think we will order this year anything. We ordered some extra VM2160 already.

It is tricky situation due to custom clearance charges.

 

 

 

Best regards,


Justyna Komańska

Import Manager

Phone no.: + 48 798 852 659

 

....................................................................................................................................................................................................

RescuLine Sp. z o.o.

Headquarter: ul. Fabryczna 17, 65-410 Zielona Góra

Company registration address: Kokosowa 67/4, 65-120 Zielona Góra

NIP: 929-202-51-63, REGON: 384987402, Nr KRS 0000816799

Numer konta bankowego: 91 1090 1535 0000 0001 4413 1079

ENG: Emails and any attachments from Resculine Ltd are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by
replying to the e-mail, then delete it without making copies or using it in any way. Although any attachments to the message will have been checked for
viruses before transmission, you are urged to carry out your own virus check before opening attachments, since Resculine Ltd accepts no responsibility
for loss or damage caused by software viruses. PL: Treść tej wiadomości może być poufna i objęta zakazem jej ujawniania. Odbiorcą może być jedynie
jej adresat z wyłączeniem dostępu osób trzecich. Jeżeli nie jesteś adresatem niniejszej wiadomości, pracownikiem upoważnionym do jej przekazania
adresatowi, niniejszym informujemy, że jej rozpowszechnianie, kopiowanie, rozprowadzanie lub inne działanie o podobnym charakterze jest prawnie
zabronione i może być karalne. Jeżeli otrzymałeś tą wiadomość omyłkowo, proszę bezzwłocznie zawiadomić nadawcę wysyłając odpowiedz i usunąć
tą wiadomość z poczty. Dziękujemy.
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Friday, November 18, 2022 2:29 PM

To: Justyna Komańska <import@resculine.pl>

Subject: Re: New order 7

 

Good afternoon Justyna,

 

I am very sorry about this mistake.  We will of course send you the two missing probes.  Please could I ask if you are
planning to order anything from us soon, then we could include these probes to avoid any customs charge you may
have?

 

Is there anything you would need us to change in the wording of the invoice to stop any issue with customs?

 

Again, please accept my sincere apologies for my mistake.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 18 Nov 2022 at 12:58, Justyna Komańska <import@resculine.pl> wrote:

Hello Kate,

 

 

We received order 7.

Unfortunately 2 sensors are missing.

We received 4 x 2160 and only 2 sensors 0014752.

What can we do about it?

 

 

 

Best regards,

Justyna Komańska

Import Manager

Phone no.: + 48 798 852 659

 

....................................................................................................................................................................................................

RescuLine Sp. z o.o.

Headquarter: ul. Fabryczna 17, 65-410 Zielona Góra

Company registration address: Kokosowa 67/4, 65-120 Zielona Góra

NIP: 929-202-51-63, REGON: 384987402, Nr KRS 0000816799

Numer konta bankowego: 91 1090 1535 0000 0001 4413 1079

ENG: Emails and any attachments from Resculine Ltd are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by
replying to the e-mail, then delete it without making copies or using it in any way. Although any attachments to the message will have been checked
for viruses before transmission, you are urged to carry out your own virus check before opening attachments, since Resculine Ltd accepts no
responsibility for loss or damage caused by software viruses. PL: Treść tej wiadomości może być poufna i objęta zakazem jej ujawniania. Odbiorcą
może być jedynie jej adresat z wyłączeniem dostępu osób trzecich. Jeżeli nie jesteś adresatem niniejszej wiadomości, pracownikiem
upoważnionym do jej przekazania adresatowi, niniejszym informujemy, że jej rozpowszechnianie, kopiowanie, rozprowadzanie lub inne działanie o
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podobnym charakterze jest prawnie zabronione i może być karalne. Jeżeli otrzymałeś tą wiadomość omyłkowo, proszę bezzwłocznie zawiadomić
nadawcę wysyłając odpowiedz i usunąć tą wiadomość z poczty. Dziękujemy.

 

 

 

 

From: Justyna Komańska <import@resculine.pl> 

Sent: Monday, November 14, 2022 3:35 PM

To: 'kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk' <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Subject: RE: New order 7

 

Hello,

 

Adult one - adult 0014752 please.

 

 

 

Best regards,

Justyna Komańska

Import Manager

Phone no.: + 48 798 852 659

 

....................................................................................................................................................................................................

RescuLine Sp. z o.o.

Headquarter: ul. Fabryczna 17, 65-410 Zielona Góra

Company registration address: Kokosowa 67/4, 65-120 Zielona Góra

NIP: 929-202-51-63, REGON: 384987402, Nr KRS 0000816799

Numer konta bankowego: 91 1090 1535 0000 0001 4413 1079

ENG: Emails and any attachments from Resculine Ltd are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by
replying to the e-mail, then delete it without making copies or using it in any way. Although any attachments to the message will have been checked
for viruses before transmission, you are urged to carry out your own virus check before opening attachments, since Resculine Ltd accepts no
responsibility for loss or damage caused by software viruses. PL: Treść tej wiadomości może być poufna i objęta zakazem jej ujawniania. Odbiorcą
może być jedynie jej adresat z wyłączeniem dostępu osób trzecich. Jeżeli nie jesteś adresatem niniejszej wiadomości, pracownikiem
upoważnionym do jej przekazania adresatowi, niniejszym informujemy, że jej rozpowszechnianie, kopiowanie, rozprowadzanie lub inne działanie o
podobnym charakterze jest prawnie zabronione i może być karalne. Jeżeli otrzymałeś tą wiadomość omyłkowo, proszę bezzwłocznie zawiadomić
nadawcę wysyłając odpowiedz i usunąć tą wiadomość z poczty. Dziękujemy.
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Monday, November 14, 2022 3:23 PM

To: Katarzyna Sokół <import@resculine.pl>

Subject: Re: New order 7

 

Good afternoon Justyna,

 

Thank you for your order.

 

Please could I ask which free of charge sensors you require with this order?  The options are as follows:

 

Silicone SpO2 sensor - adult 0014752

or

Silicone SpO2 sensor - Medium (small adult) 0014754

or

Silicone SpO2 sensor - paediatric 0014753

or

Silicone wrap sensor 0014851

or

Ear sensor 0014850

or

Finger SpO2 sensor (hard shell) 0014651


 

I await your reply.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 14 Nov 2022 at 13:58, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Justyna Komańska <import@resculine.pl>

Date: Mon, 14 Nov 2022 at 13:56

Subject: New order 7

To: <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

 

Hello,

 

Please find enclosed our new purchase order. I look forward to receiving Order confirmation with estimated
date of dispatch.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Best regards,

Justyna Komańska

Import Manager

Phone no.: + 48 798 852 659

....................................................................................................................................................................................................



RescuLine Sp. z o.o.

Headquarter: ul. Fabryczna 17, 65-410 Zielona Góra

Company registration address: Kokosowa 67/4, 65-120 Zielona Góra

NIP: 929-202-51-63, REGON: 384987402, Nr KRS 0000816799

Numer konta bankowego: 91 1090 1535 0000 0001 4413 1079
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ENG: Emails and any attachments from Resculine Ltd are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately by replying to the e-mail, then delete it without making copies or using it in any way. Although any attachments to the message will
have been checked for viruses before transmission, you are urged to carry out your own virus check before opening attachments, since
Resculine Ltd accepts no responsibility for loss or damage caused by software viruses. PL: Treść tej wiadomości może być poufna i objęta
zakazem jej ujawniania. Odbiorcą może być jedynie jej adresat z wyłączeniem dostępu osób trzecich. Jeżeli nie jesteś adresatem niniejszej
wiadomości, pracownikiem upoważnionym do jej przekazania adresatowi, niniejszym informujemy, że jej rozpowszechnianie, kopiowanie,
rozprowadzanie lub inne działanie o podobnym charakterze jest prawnie zabronione i może być karalne. Jeżeli otrzymałeś tą wiadomość
omyłkowo, proszę bezzwłocznie zawiadomić nadawcę wysyłając odpowiedz i usunąć tą wiadomość z poczty. Dziękujemy.

 

 


