16/11/2022, 10:09 Gmail - Fwd: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN130052-1

M Gma” Michael Lamb <viamed.michael.lamb@gmail.com>

Fwd: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN130052-1

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 November 2022 at 07:52
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Dan (Gasbolaget AB) <dan@gasbolaget.se>
Date: Tue, 15 Nov 2022, 17:52

Subject: Sv: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN130052-1
To: <accounts@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hello. | need to order 2 pcs of RAN130052-1 Oxygen sensor R-17VAN, (same as
in invoice RAN130052-1)

Best Regards

Dan Steinland

Gasbolaget i Dalarna AB
Ragvaldsberg 4

SE-791 96 FALUN
Sweden

Mobil: +46 (0)70-796 80 55
www.gasbolaget.se

Fran: accounts@vandagraph.co.uk <accounts@vandagraph.co.uk>
Skickat: den 27 april 2021 16:17

Till: dan@gasbolaget.se

Amne: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN130052-1

Please find attached invoice(s) from Vandagraph Ltd.

Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us.
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk

Regards

Accounts Department
Vandagraph Ltd
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk

Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.
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