15/11/2022, 13:05 Gmail - RE: Request for Quotation - Tecnomar R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor

M Gma” Michael Lamb <viamed.michael.lamb@gmail.com>

RE: Request for Quotation - Tecnomar R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 15 November 2022 at 07:48

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Premiers for Equipment <premierq@eim.ae>

Date: Tue, 15 Nov 2022, 06:23

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Tecnomar R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor

To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Cc: Premiers-Diving Branch <premierb@emirates.net.ae>

Dear Ryan,

Please kindly quote your best price and availability including shipping for the below item:
Qty: 4 nos.

Tecnomar R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor

Best regards,

Mags Villareal

Premiers For Equipment

P.O. Box 37438, Abu Dhabi, UAE
Tel.: +971-2-666 5226

Fax: +971-2-666 5229

Web: www.premiers-uae.com

Email: premierq@eim.ae

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 4:17 PM

To: Premiers for Equipment <premierq@eim.ae>

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation - Tecnomar R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor
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15/11/2022, 13:05 Gmail - RE: Request for Quotation - Tecnomar R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor

Thank you Mags

Your payment has been received and your order is currently with our warehouse.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 18 Jul 2022 at 13:25, Premiers for Equipment <premierq@eim.ae> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Please find attached our bank’s confirmation of our transfer payment.

Kindly confirm by return if the funds is credited to your account.

Best regards,

Mags Villareal

Premiers For Equipment

P.O. Box 37438, Abu Dhabi, UAE
Tel.: +971-2-666 5226

Fax: +971-2-666 5229

Web: www.premiers-uae.com

Email: premierq@eim.ae
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, July 14, 2022 6:52 PM

To: Premiers for Equipment <premierq@eim.ae>

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation - Tecnomar R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor

Dear Mags

Your previous proforma has been deleted, as it had expired, but please find a new one attached.

Please let me know as soon as you make the payment.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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