14/11/2022, 09:57 Gmail - RE: Purchase Order Confirmation - 23040 - VIAMED - 28-10-2022

M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Purchase Order Confirmation - 23040 - VIAMED - 28-10-2022

1 message

Kelly Beardmore <kellybeardmore@jchmarineoffshore.com> 14 November 2022 at 09:56
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Debra Evans <DebraEvans@)jchmarineoffshore.com>, Ella Morrey <EllaMorrey@jchmarineoffshore.com>

Good afternoon Kate
Customer will wait for the original order

Best regards

**%* PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS DETAILS

Kelly Beardmore

Operations Manager

JCH Marine & Offshore Supplies Ltd
JCH House

Highgate Trade Park

Charles Clowes Drive

Stoke On Trent

Staffordshire ST6 4JZ

United Kingdom

@Main Tel: +44 (0) 1782 855406
2 Fax: +44 (0) 1782 855407

EWebsite: www.jchmarineoffshore.com
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1SO 9001

From: Ella Morrey <EllaMorrey@jchmarineoffshore.com>

Sent: 10 November 2022 16:19

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Cc: Debra Evans <DebraEvans@jchmarineoffshore.com>; Kelly Beardmore <kellybeardmore@
jchmarineoffshore.com>

Subject: RE: Purchase Order Confirmation - 23040 - VIAMED - 28-10-2022

Good Afternoon
Not yet sorry.
Kind Regards

**%* PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS DETAILS AND MOBILE NUMBER AS FOLLOWS:

Ella Morrey

Purchasing Assistant

JCH Marine & Offshore Supplies Ltd
JCH House

Highgate Trade Park

Charles Clowes Drive

Stoke On Trent

Staffordshire ST6 4JZ

United Kingdom

(Main Tel: +44 (0) 1782 855406
2 Fax: +44 (0) 1782 855407

:Website: www.jchmarineoffshore.com
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 10 November 2022 16:16

To: Ella Morrey <EllaMorrey@jchmarineoffshore.com>

Subject: Re: Purchase Order Confirmation - 23040 - VIAMED - 28-10-2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of JCH Marine. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Good afternoon Ella,

Just a quick email to ask if we are able to proceed with your order?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 3 Nov 2022 at 11:01, Ella Morrey <EllaMorrey@jchmarineoffshore.com> wrote:

Good Morning

| am wating for my customer to confirm.

Kind regards

**%* PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS DETAILS AND MOBILE NUMBER AS FOLLOWS:

Ella Morrey

Purchasing Assistant

JCH Marine & Offshore Supplies Ltd
JCH House

Highgate Trade Park

Charles Clowes Drive

Stoke On Trent

Staffordshire ST6 4JZ

United Kingdom

(Main Tel: +44 (0) 1782 855406
2 Fax: +44 (0) 1782 855407

:Website: www.jchmarineoffshore.com
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 03 November 2022 10:55

To: Ella Morrey <EllaMorrey@jchmarineoffshore.com>; Debra Evans <DebraEvans@jchmarineoffshore.com>;
Kelly Beardmore <kellybeardmore@jchmarineoffshore.com>

Cc: Steve Hardaker <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>

Subject: Re: Purchase Order Confirmation - 23040 - VIAMED - 28-10-2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of JCH Marine. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Good morning Ella,

| hope you are well.

Just a quick email to ask if you would like us to continue with your original order, or change it to part number
0110049 - R-49V?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 28 Oct 2022 at 17:26, Steve Hardaker <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Ella,

Thank you for your order. Unfortunately, the specific sensor that you have ordered (0110581 - Oxygen sensor
O0M202) is not currently in stock. We expect the lead-time to be a few weeks. We do however have a direct
alternative, which is the same specification but lower cost:

Part No: 0110049 - Oxygen sensor R-49V

1-off: £42.00+VAT
2-off: £40.00+VAT
3-10: £38.00+VAT
11+: £36.00+VAT

Carriage is FOC.

I have attached the relevant data sheet and DoC as requested. Do you want to order this sensor instead?
Please note: for the first order with a new customer, we work on a pro-forma basis, but should you wish to
continue to order from Viamed, we can send you a credit application form to grant a 30-day credit
account subject to approval.

I look forward to hearing from you.

Best Regards,

Steve Hardaker

Technical Support Manager

Viamed Ltd.

Please note: Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

Website: www.viamed.co.uk

email: steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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Facebook: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
Company registered in England, No. 1291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or

call +44 (0)1535 634542
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Good Afternoon

Please find attached Our Purchase Order.

**WE HAVE ELIMINATED ALL PLASTICS AND NON RECYCABLE PACKAGING, PLEASE DO NOT SEND ANY
WITH GOODS.

Please acknowledge receipt of order within 24hrs along with delivery date - Please inform if there will be any delays due to
the COVID-19 Outbreak

All wooden packaging must be Heat Treated

Any hazardous items must come with relevant MSDS

We also do not except Part shipments unless requested

Our new address as of the 13™ July 2020 for deliveries and invoices is:

JCH House

Unit 1

Highgate Trade Park
Charles Clowes Drive
Off Brownhills Road

STOKE-ON-TRENT

ST6 4JZ

**** PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS DETAILS AND MOBILE NUMBER AS
FOLLOWS:
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Ella Morrey

Trainee Purchasing Assistant

JCH Marine & Offshore Supplies Ltd
JCH House

Highgate Trade Park

Charles Clowes Drive

Stoke On Trent

Staffordshire ST6 4JZ

United Kingdom

(Main Tel: +44 (0) 1782 855406
2 Fax: +44 (0) 1782 855407

:Website: www.jchmarineoffshore.com
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