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M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

AW: Enquiry MED-150.1 Viamed

1 message

kontakt@hts-trading.de <kontaki@hts-trading.de> 11 November 2022 at 10:04

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

You can delete this proforma invoice this time.

Thank you!

Best regards/ Mit freundlichen Grifen

Irina Pinekenstein

HTS Elektrotechnik GmbH
Eresburgstr. 24-29

Gebaude 1, 1.0G
12103 Berlin
Germany

kontakt@hts-trading.de

Tel: +49 (0)30 326-78-756
Tel: +49 (0)30 720-12-483
Fax: +49 (0)30 326-78-769

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Kate Giriffiths
Gesendet: Freitag, 11. November 2022 10:55

An: HTS Elektrotechnik GmbH <kontakt@hts-trading.de>

Betreff: Re: Enquiry MED-150.1 Viamed

Good morning Irina,

Just a quick email to ask if proforma invoice MVM139998 is still required? It expires on November 27th, at which
time | would need to delete it and it becomes invalid to be used for payment.

| can of course issue another proforma invoice at any time.
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Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@yviamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 28 Oct 2022 at 11:30, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Irina,

Thank you for your order.

Please see attached proforma invoice with prices. Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.
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As you are aware, we have no stock of part number 0110433 - oxygen sensor MAX-250K. The stock that will be
available in December has been allocated, so the new lead time would be longer than that.

All other items are currently in stock, though part number 0110431 - oxygen sensor MAX-250A has very low stock
which | think will be purchased very soon.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Thu, 27 Oct 2022 at 15:14, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: <kontakt@hts-trading.de>
Date: Thu, 27 Oct 2022 at 15:11
Subject: Enquiry MED-150.1 Viamed
To: <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sophie,

We would like to place an order for

1.MAX250A R125P04-001- 15 pcs.

2.0131524 - Connector 2 pole black socket 1mm with hood—12 pcs

3.0131527 - Connector 3 pole black socket 1mm with hood — 12 pcs
4.MAX250K Viasys R125P11-001 -5 pcs (when you have it on stock)

5.MAX250E R125P03-002 -5 pcs (when you have it on stock

Are the prices the same?

What is the current delivery time?

Best regards/ Mit freundlichen Grufen

Irina Pinekenstein

HTS Elektrotechnik GmbH
Eresburgstr. 24-29

Gebaude 1, 1.0G
12103 Berlin
Germany

kontakt@hts-trading.de

Tel: +49 (0)30 326-78-756
Tel: +49 (0)30 720-12-483
Fax: +49 (0)30 326-78-769
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