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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Microstim DB3 Accessories

1 message

Reynolds, Laura <lreynolds@lwdh.on.ca> 8 November 
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

 

Our address is:

 

Attention Laura Reynolds

Lake of the Woods District Hospital

21 Sylvan Street

Kenora, Ontario, Canada

P9N 3W7

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: November 4, 2022 10:52 AM

To: Reynolds, Laura <lreynolds@lwdh.on.ca>

Subject: Re: Microstim DB3 Accessories

 

Hi Laura,

 

Thank you for your reply.

 

If you need a proforma invoice from us, I would just need your delivery and invoice addresses in order to create an account for you.  Then I can create a proforma invoice 

which will show our company details, address and bank details.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please 

continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Fri, 4 Nov 2022 at 15:39, Reynolds, Laura <lreynolds@lwdh.on.ca> wrote:

Hi Kate!

 

Thanks for responding. I would love to purchase. I will need the invoice detailing carriage charges, bank information and unsure.

 

I can get our information for you on our purchase order.

 

I will set you up as a new vendor.

 

Thank you,

 

Laura

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: November 4, 2022 6:37 AM

To: Reynolds, Laura <lreynolds@lwdh.on.ca>

Subject: Re: Microstim DB3 Accessories

 

Good morning Laura,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.

 

We do not have Canadian registration, but we would be happy to assist.

 

The prices of part number 2520003 - Microstim DB3 patient lead, 1.5m length, terminated with pinch clamp connections is $26.10 each EXW.

 

Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, bank charges and insurance.  If so, I would need your delivery and invoice addresses 

in order to create an account for you.

 

We do not have a distributor in Canada.

 

Many thanks.




Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but 

please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email
kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter:
twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 4 Nov 2022 at 08:11, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Reynolds, Laura <lreynolds@lwdh.on.ca>

Date: Thu, 3 Nov 2022 at 17:05

Subject: Microstim DB3 Accessories

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

 

Hello,

 

I was hoping you could help me . I am looking to purchase new leads for our Microstim DB3s we have in our OR.

 

Do you have a Canadian distributor?

 

This is the item I need.

 

Laura

 

 

Laura Reynolds, RN
MANAGER – Operating Room/Recovery Room/Pre-Op Clinic

Surgical Services

 

Lake of the Woods District Hospital

21 Sylvan St. W

Kenora, ON P9N 3W7

lreynolds@lwdh.on.ca

P: 807.468.9861 Ext. 2456



www.lwdh.on.ca
/ anh.lwdh.on.ca  

 

This message including any attachments, is intended for the use of the named recipient(s) and may contain privileged
and/or confidential information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distributi
communication to other persons is prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please contact the sender immediately by reply email and destroy all copies
of the original message. Thank you for your
and assistance.
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