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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Enquiry Analox 9100-9212-3

1 message

john <john@chambersoceanicsfzc.com> 4 November 2022 at 05:16
To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Cc: shiva@chambersoceanicsfzc.com, Sheldon D'Lima <sheldon@chambersoceanicsfzc.com>

Hi Ryan 

Nice talking to you yesterday .

As per your request please see our email for the replacement O2 sensors .

We have been ordering direct and payment also being made from our Dubai office .  If Ok with you we can 
issue PO immediately and request you to send us your proforma invoice to process payment .

Thank you for your support . 

Due to upgradation of our server kindly respond to new email id’s. Thank you and regret inconvenience

Kind Regards

John D’Lima


T: +971 4 5800112

M: +971 55 699 9130 

E: john@chambersoceanicsfzc.com


Chambers Oceanics FZC

W360 Dubai Maritime City, Near Dubai Drydocks Dubai, UAE


From: <shiva@chambersoceanicsfzc.com>

Subject: FW: Enquiry Analox 9100-9212-3

Date: November 3, 2022 at 3:07:22 PM GMT+4

To: <sheldon@chambersoceanicsfzc.com>, <john@chambersoceanicsfzc.com>


FYI
 
From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: Thursday, 3 November 2022 3:04 PM

To: shiva@chambersoceanicsfzc.com

Subject: Re: Enquiry Analox 9100-9212-3
 
Hi Shivakumar
 
Thank you very much for your enquiry. 
 
The sensors you require are the R-33VAN-3 and they are available, we would need 7-10 days to assemble them.
 
Please can you send your enquiry via Chambers Oceanics UK for pricing information.
 
Best regards
Ryan
 
Ryan Swaine
General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Thu, 3 Nov 2022 at 07:03, <shiva@chambersoceanicsfzc.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,
Hope doing well.
Could you advise with availability and pricing on below mentioned. Alternate advisable.
 
Analox 9100-9212-3 Replacement Oxygen (O2) Sensor (0-100%) for Ax 1000 Oxygen Monitor  -- QTY 2
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Kind Regards,
 

Shivakumar U S



T:  +971 4 5800112

M: +971 58 594 6999

E:  shiva@chambersoceanicsfzc.
com



Chambers Oceanics FZC

W360 Dubai Maritime City, Near
Dubai Drydocks Dubai, UAE

    www.chambersoceanics.com
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