07/11/2022, 10:36 Gmail - RE: FW: question R22

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: FW: question R22

1 message

Enrico Gaal | DUC Marine Group <enricog@ducmarinegroup.com> 7 November 2022 at 10:09
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Good morning Ryan,
| would like to order the same sensors as Tjeerd has done,

+ 6x R-22VAN (D-05)
+ 6x R-17VAN (GOEL370)

Please sent the invoice so we can transfer the payment.
Normal shipment is ok.

What will be the delivery time aprox. ?

Met vriendelijke groeten,

Enrico Gaal

Technische dienst

DUC Diving B.V.
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T 1431527684444 |- enricog@ducmarinegroup.com

£ +31683 331261 @ www.ducmarinegroup.com
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Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Ryan Swaine
Verzonden: dinsdag 4 oktober 2022 13:14

Aan: Tjeerd Hoekstra | DUC Marine Group <tjeerdh@ducmarinegroup.com>
CC: Enrico Gaal | DUC Marine Group <enricog@ducmarinegroup.com>
Onderwerp: Re: FW: question R22

Thank you Tjeerd

| expect it will arrive with us in the next few days. Your order has been sent over to our warehouse, it should be
dispatched at the latest tomorrow.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 3 Oct 2022 at 14:35, Tjeerd Hoekstra | DUC Marine Group <tjeerdh@ducmarinegroup.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

See attached the EORI number and payment document.

Normal shipment is ok.

Thanks!

Yours sincerely,

Tjeerd Hoekstra

DUC Diving B.V.
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VAT no. NL 8014.00.405.B01
DUC Marine Group | Marsdiep 23 | 8321 MC URK | NL

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Ryan Swaine
Verzonden: maandag 3 oktober 2022 14:25

Aan: Tjeerd Hoekstra | DUC Marine Group <tjeerdh@ducmarinegroup.com>
CC: Enrico Gaal | DUC Marine Group <enricog@ducmarinegroup.com>
Onderwerp: Re: question R22

Dear Tjeerd

Thank you very much for your email.

Please find a proforma invoice attached, | have applied our trade pricing.

Please can you let me know if your company eori number is the same as your VAT number?

The sensors are available from stock and we would endeavour to dispatch your order as soon as payment is
received by either bank transfer or credit card.

| have added the transport by UPS-Standard which takes approximately 3-4 days. We can offer an overnight
service if required, but the cost would be considerably higher.

| look forward to your feedback and any questions you may have.

Please let me know if you proceed with a bank payment, so | can keep an eye on our bank and minimise any
potential delays.

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 3 Oct 2022 at 07:23, Tjeerd Hoekstra | DUC Marine Group <tjeerdh@ducmarinegroup.com> wrote:

Good morning Ryan,

Can we order some sensors directly?

What will be the delivery time?

« 6x R-22VAN (D-05)
« 6x R-17VAN (GOEL370)

Here by our company details.

VAT no. NL 8014.00.405.B01

DUC Marine Group | Marsdiep 23 | 8321 MC URK | NL
Yours sincerely,

Tjeerd Hoekstra

DUC Diving B.V.
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VAT no. NL 8014.00.405.B01

DUC Marine Group | Marsdiep 23 | 8321 MC URK | NL

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Ryan Swaine
Verzonden: woensdag 2 maart 2022 11:23

Aan: Tjeerd Hoekstra | DUC Marine Group <tjeerdh@ducmarinegroup.com>
Onderwerp: Re: question R22

Dear Tjeerd

Thank you very much for your email.

I can confirm that the R-22VAN would be a suitable replacement as long as it is for surface use. It is not suitable
for use in rebreathers.

Please let me know if you have any other questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 2 Mar 2022 at 10:00, Tjeerd Hoekstra | DUC Marine Group <tjeerdh@ducmarinegroup.com> wrote:

Goodmorning,

| have a question about the R-22VAN oxygen sensor, is this the same or good replaceable sensor for the D-
05 /NRC 02 sensor?

Can you please advise use?
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Yours sincerely,
Tjeerd Hoekstra

DUC Diving B.V.
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£ +31 647998 772 @ www.ducmarinegroup.com
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DUC Marine Group | Marsdiep 23 | 8321 MC URK | NL

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail
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