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M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Purchase Order Confirmation - 23040 - VIAMED - 28-10-2022

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 28 October 2022 at 16:00

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>, Janine Gill
<janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hey can one of you process this as | was asking SH if its not a scam, but don't have time left as am going now.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ella Morrey <EllaMorrey@jchmarineoffshore.com>

Date: Fri, 28 Oct 2022 at 16:45

Subject: Purchase Order Confirmation - 23040 - VIAMED - 28-10-2022

To: office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Debra Evans <DebraEvans@jchmarineoffshore.com>, Kelly Beardmore <kellybeardmore@
jchmarineoffshore.com>

Good Afternoon

Please find attached Our Purchase Order.

**WE HAVE ELIMINATED ALL PLASTICS AND NON RECYCABLE PACKAGING, PLEASE DO NOT SEND ANY
WITH GOODS.

Please acknowledge receipt of order within 24hrs along with delivery date - Please inform if there will be any delays due to the
COVID-19 Outbreak

All wooden packaging must be Heat Treated

Any hazardous items must come with relevant MSDS

We also do not except Part shipments unless requested

Our new address as of the 13 July 2020 for deliveries and invoices is:

JCH House
Unit 1
Highgate Trade Park

Charles Clowes Drive

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1747947737338979961%7Cmsg-f%3A174794773...
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Off Brownhills Road

STOKE-ON-TRENT

ST6 4JZ

**%** PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS DETAILS AND MOBILE NUMBER AS FOLLOWS:

Ella Morrey

Trainee Purchasing Assistant

JCH Marine & Offshore Supplies Ltd
JCH House

Highgate Trade Park

Charles Clowes Drive

Stoke On Trent

Staffordshire ST6 4JZ

United Kingdom

(Main Tel: +44 (0) 1782 855406
2 Fax: +44 (0) 1782 855407

:Website: www.jchmarineoffshore.com

Purchasing
Association

) |
B e ()
Marine |

Cert No. 16307

1SO 9001
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