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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen sensor - R-44V

1 message

Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> 1 November 2022 at 11:39
Reply-To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

Kind regards


Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 
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may be unlawful.


If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542
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-----------------


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Andy Young <andy@ozone-industries.co.uk>

Date: Tue, Nov 1, 2022 at 6:46 AM

Subject: RE: Oxygen sensor - R-44V

To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>


Hi Sophie

 

Our order for the sensor is attached.
Please forward a proforma so we can arrange payment.

 

Thanks

 

andy
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Sophie Lines

Sent: 31 October 2022 16:26

To: Andy Young <andy@ozone-industries.co.uk>

Subject: Re: Oxygen sensor - R-44V

 

Dear Andy, 

 

Thank you for your email.

 

I can confirm the price breaks for part number 0110044 (R-44V Oxygen Sensor) are as follows:

 

1 unit - £42.00

2 unit - £40.00

3-10 units - £38.00

11+ units - £36.00

 

Prices exclude VAT. Delivery is free of charge on this product - we currently have 20 units in stock

 

If you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards


Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 
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On Mon, Oct 31, 2022 at 4:16 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Andy Young <andy@ozone-industries.co.uk>

Date: Mon, 31 Oct 2022 at 15:42

Subject: Oxygen sensor - R-44V

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

 

Hi

 

Could you provide me with a price and availability for a Devilbiss hand held oxygen sensor (R-44V 0110044).

 

Thanks

 

andy

 

Andy Young.PhD

Ozone Industries Ltd

Unit 3

Regents Court

Walworth Industrial Estate

Andover

SP10 5NX

Tel  07710 740252

Web
https://www.ozone-industries.co.uk/
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