28/10/2022, 14:54 Gmail - Re: P.O. 2781

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: P.O. 2781

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 28 October 2022 at 14:50

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
To: Aiapavtrig Koptéang <diamantis@cmedical.gr>
Cc: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Diamond
| apologise that you were not informed, | take responsibility for that.

For this order we can agree to:
0015011 = EUR €165
0015012 = EUR €180

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

Viamed are pleased to be exhibiting at Medica
14th to 17th November 2022
Hall 16 / H-15-4

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 26 Oct 2022 at 07:35, AlapavTrg Koptéong <diamantis@cmedical.gr> wrote:
Hi Ryan,
These are bad news indeed.

The point is that you didn’t inform me on time about those changes!

My question is if you could give me the old prices for this order only, as an exception. | cannot change now the
given end user price to my costumer.

What are the prices for reusable sensors?

Please also send us the revised price list for both reusable and disposable sensors.

Best Regards,

Diamond Cortessis

General Manager
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