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M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

AW: order about D40

1 message

Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> 21 October 2022 at 08:49
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Good Morning Ryan
Hope you are fine. Thank you very much for your mail.

We appreciate the new price- can you please make a new production about 50 pieces for us — and another order
about 50 pieces end of December?

Can you please send me the order confirmation with an expected shipping date — week will be enough?

Thank you very much and | am waiting for the 20 cells — please send the shipping number when available.

Mit freundlichen GriRen / With kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

NRC International GmbH
Karlstr. 21 A

51702 Bergneustadt
Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

POWER IN NITROX K/[0(

Wir wiirden uns liber Ihr Feedback freuen. Veréffentlichen Sie doch eine Rezension in unserem Google-Profil.
NRC International GmbH would love your feedback. Post a review to our profile.

https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sI7bNEAo/review

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Dienstag, 11. Oktober 2022 16:49

An: Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com>

Betreff: Re: order about D40

Hi Andrea

| am sorry for the delay.
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The component sensors are being tested and will be ready for production tomorrow. | am hoping that we can have
them ready next week.

With regards to the pricing, we are raising the trade price of the D-40 to £40 and we can continue to give you a further
15% discount, which brings your price to GBP £34.

The D-09 will be raised to £38, but with your discount will be GBP £32.30

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 11 Oct 2022 at 09:29, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:
Hello Ryan
Any news?

What about the new prices, | urgently need to place a new order.

Mit freundlichen Gruf3en / With kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

NRC International GmbH
Karlstr. 21 A

51702 Bergneustadt
Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

OWER IN NITROX N[0
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Wir wiirden uns liber Ihr Feedback freuen. Veroffentlichen Sie doch eine Rezension in unserem Google-
Profil.

NRC International GmbH would love your feedback. Post a review to our profile.

https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sI7bNEAo/review

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Mittwoch, 28. September 2022 16:30

An: Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com>

Betreff: Re: order about D40

Hi Andrea,

We are now expecting the sensor components to arrive next week, if everything goes to plan. We need at least
another 7-10 days to assemble them.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 26 Sept 2022 at 09:28, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:
Hello Ryan
| am sold out by this sensor, and still waiting for any information about the last order for 20 pieces.

Can you tell me anything about the new prices for us? So | have to make a new order- but need this information
first- of course.

Mit freundlichen Grif3en / With kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

NRC International GmbH
Karlstr. 21 A
51702 Bergneustadt

Germany
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Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

OWER IN NITROX N[0

Wir wiirden uns liber Ihr Feedback freuen. Veroffentlichen Sie doch eine Rezension in unserem Google-
Profil.

NRC International GmbH would love your feedback. Post a review to our profile.

https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sI7bNEAo/review

Von: Andrea Krieger

Gesendet: Montag, 22. August 2022 11:19
An: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Betreff: AW: order about D40

Good morning Ryan,

good news, thank you verry much.

Mit freundlichen Gruf3en / With kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

NRC International GmbH
Karlstr. 21 A

51702 Bergneustadt
Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

OWER IN NITROX K[}

Wir wiirden uns liber Ihr Feedback freuen. Veroffentlichen Sie doch eine Rezension in unserem Google-
Profil.

NRC International GmbH would love your feedback. Post a review to our profile.

https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sI7bNEAo/review

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Freitag, 19. August 2022 17:17
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An: Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com>
Betreff: Re: order about D40

Hi Andrea

We will have them ready for dispatch early next week.

Please have a great weekend, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 19 Aug 2022 at 11:14, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:
Hello Ryan

Any news about a shipping date?

Mit freundlichen Gruf3en / With kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

NRC International GmbH
Karlstr. 21 A

51702 Bergneustadt
Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

-

Wir wiirden uns liber Ihr Feedback freuen. Veroffentlichen Sie doch eine Rezension in unserem
Google-Profil.

NRC International GmbH would love your feedback. Post a review to our profile.

https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sl7bNEAo/review

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1571886351361733621%7Cmsg-f%3A174728262... 5/11


mailto:krieger@nrc-international.com
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:krieger@nrc-international.com
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Karlstr.+21?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.nrc-international.com/
https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sl7bNEAo/review

26/10/2022, 15:38

Vo

Gmail - AW: order about D40

n: viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine

Gesendet: Dienstag, 22. August 2017 12:25
An: Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com>
Betreff: Re: order about D40

Hi

Andrea

No problem, we can send it directly to your customer.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On 22 August 2017 at 10:51, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

https://mail.google

Dear Ryan

Will you please do me a favor? The customer is in Kent and it will make sense if you can send it directly to
him.

Here the address:
Keith Wood

14 Lake Walk
Larkfield, Aylesford
ME20 6TB

Thank you in advance if this will be possible. Otherwise please send the cell back to us.
Kind Regards

Andrea

Von: viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com [mailto:viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Ryan
Swaine
Gesendet: Montag, 21. August 2017 17:13
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An: Andrea Krieger
Betreff: Re: order about D40

Hi Andrea

| hope you had a nice weekend.

We have tested your sensor and we have not been able to find any fault.

We initially installed the sensor in to an O2EIl and it worked fine. We then tested the mV output of the
sensor in both air and O2 to check the linearity, the sensor performed perfectly:

27,4mV in air and 129.9mV in O2

Are you happy for me to post the sensor back to you?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On 14 August 2017 at 11:33, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan

Hope you are fine- i have a reclamation about one D40 cell SN 782463- shall | send the cell to your office
for checkback what is the fault?

The customer told me that the cell worked fine for a few days and the the readout simply vaies between
0,1 and 0,4. What do you think?

Kind Regards
Andrea
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NRC International GmbH
Stentenberg Str. 63
51702 Bergneustadt
Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

POWER IN NITROX NRC

Von: viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com [mailto:viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Ryan
Swaine

Gesendet: Dienstag, 4. Juli 2017 10:47

An: Andrea Krieger

Betreff: Re: order about D40

Hi Andrea

Thank you for your email.

Our version of your D09 is the R-33S1 and we would be happy to offer you same pricing and discount as
we offer you for the D-40:

R-33S1 - labelled as the NRC D-09 = (GBP) £35.00 -15% discount

| assume that you would want us to label the sensor for you as the NRC D-097

With regards to stock, we are also awaiting these from the USA and we are expecting to receive them at
the same time as the D-40 component sensors.

| will need a little bit of prior notice if you want to go ahead, so that | can set up the artwork for the label.

I look forward to your response and please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On 4 July 2017 at 09:12, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan

Another question- i like to have an offer for the cell D09 for Analox Mini 02 (OMS,UBS) —

Will you please make me an offer about quantity 50 pieces? We will order in quantity about 25 per each
delivery.

Kind Regards

Andrea

NRC International GmbH
Stentenberg Str. 63
51702 Bergneustadt
Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

Von: viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com [mailto:viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Ryan
Swaine

Gesendet: Montag, 3. Juli 2017 10:23

An: Andrea Krieger

Betreff: Re: order about D40

Hi Andrea
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| am very sorry, there has been some delays on the manufacture of the component sensor in the USA and
the latest information is that we will receive them during the 3rd week in July and then we have to put them
in to production.

We will continue to chase them in the hope that we can bring the delivery date forward.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On 3 July 2017 at 08:39, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan

My last information is that we cannot get the new delivery before end of July. | think this is such too long to
wait.

Can you please check if there is anything possible to get the delivery earlier?

Kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

NRC International GmbH
Stentenberg Str. 63
51702 Bergneustadt
Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

'POWER IN NITROX NRC
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