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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: new order 62201642

1 message

Daniel Lacey <D.Lacey@jfdglobal.com> 26 October 2022 at 00:28
To: "steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com" <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>, AccountsPayable AU
<AccountsPayableAU@jfdglobal.com>
Cc: "kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com" <kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com>

Sorry for the confiusion there Steve, I didn’t realise it would print that way

 

Updated PO with correct dates showing now

 

Regards

 

Dan

 

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of
Steve Nixon

Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 4:23 AM

To: AccountsPayable AU <AccountsPayableAU@jfdglobal.com>

Cc: Daniel Lacey <D.Lacey@jfdglobal.com>; kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com

Subject: Re: new order 62201642

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Hi Bamboo

 

The order states staggered delivery, but the delivery dates seem to be the same.

 

0001  48 sensors 20/3/23

 

0002  48 sensors 20/3/23

 

0003 24 sensors 20/3/23

 

 

Regards
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Steve

 

On Tue, 25 Oct 2022 at 04:25, AccountsPayable AU <AccountsPayableAU@jfdglobal.com> wrote:

Hello

 

Can you please send Proforma invoices for attached PO 62201642 ?

Regards

Bamboo Gray

 

From: Daniel Lacey <D.Lacey@jfdglobal.com>


Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 11:20 AM

To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com;
kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com

Cc: David Lewry <D.Lewry@jfdglobal.com>; Jacky Tong <J.Tong@jfdglobal.com>; AccountsPayable AU
<AccountsPayableAU@jfdglobal.com>

Subject: new order 62201642

 

Good morning Steve and Kate

 

Please find attached new purchase order – please note the staggered delivery times

 

Any issues please let me know

 

Daniel Lacey Purchasing Officer

D.Lacey@jfdglobal.com  



JFD 

Office: +61 (0)8 6164 4400 / Fax: +61 (0)8 6164 4490 

54 Bushland Ridge, Bibra Lake, Perth, WA 6163 

Australia

jfdglobal.com

Follow us on:
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Steve Nixon

Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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