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Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Viamed 322 order

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Oct 25, 2022 at 8:47 AM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Alexandru Cernat <provision@liamed.ro>

Date: Tue, 25 Oct 2022 at 06:15

Subject: Viamed 322 order

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>


Good morning,

Enclosed you will find our new order, please issue the proforma invoice in Euro.

Cu stima / Best regards


 Alex
CERNAT - Provision Department

 SC LIAMED SRL

 Bd. Grivitei Nr. A8  Brasov - 500182   Romania

 Tel/Fax: +4 0268 327 490  Mob: +4 0757
097
373  

 provision@liamed.ro   
 www.liamed.ro
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