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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Re : Re: Rebreather oxgen cell

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 24 October 2022 at 15:25
Reply-To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com
To: office@vmsecure.me.uk
Cc: cathy.green@vmsecure.me.uk

Please process a VST proforma invoice to cover the order from the new customer and send to Air Research  
etienne@air-research.ch

20 x 8010000 @ £38.00 each

EXW


Shipping address is :


Mr SORMANI Eric

Rue de Fremis, 35
1241 Puplinge

Switzerland
email : contact@air-research.ch

phone : +41 79 778 53 76

VAT Number : CHE 402 933 525


They will collect, just need to send weight and dimensions to Etienne and ask for the details of their
courier/shipper.

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Air Research <etienne@air-research.ch>

Date: Mon, 24 Oct 2022 at 14:31

Subject: Re: Re : Re: Rebreather oxgen cell

To: <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>


Hi Steve, 


Thank you for your answer.

So we can go ahead, and keep our fingers crossed for the production time ;) .

We will pay you the invoice as soon as it is issued.

Have a nice day, all the best, 


Etienne MENAGER, M.D.
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------- Original Message -------

Le lundi 24 octobre 2022 à 15:25, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :


Hi Etienne

I can't provide an absolute guarantee, but at the moment we have scheduled to ship in time and we are
proceeding with production.

Regards

Steve

On Mon, 24 Oct 2022 at 12:51, Air Research <etienne@air-research.ch> wrote:

Hi Steve, 



Have you somes news about our last mail ? 



Best regards, have a nice day



Etienne MENAGER, M.D.






www.air-research.ch





------- Original Message -------

Le mardi 18 octobre 2022 à 18:25, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :




Hi Etienne


Can you please leave it with me for a couple of days, I will be in the office tomorrow.




Regards


Steve


On Mon, 17 Oct 2022 at 22:38, Air Research <etienne@air-research.ch> wrote:


Dear Steve,


Thank you for the clarification. Indeed, the 3 weeks delay is very short.


Do you think it is possible to send the cells before November 21, as a
maximum deadline?


I'm asking you this question because we plan to travel several weeks with the
prototypes to test the material far from home, and the plane is scheduled for
November 24... in the short term, we must get these cells before this date.


If this time is too short for production, then I think it is more reasonable to buy
some oxygen cells elsewhere, and come back to you in a few months to start
testing.


On the other hand, if it is possible to ship before November 21, then go ahead
:)


A very good evening, best regards


Etienne MENAGER, M.D.
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www.air-research.ch









-- 

Steve
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

-- 

 
 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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