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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217) - Indian Ocean Water Sports order

1 message

Emma Andrews <emma@crystaldiversmu.com> 17 October 2022 at 17:27
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: Tony Andrews <tony@crystaldiversmu.com>

Thanks Ryan

Please can you update the shipping address to:
Patrick Malluzzo

138a Heath Lane (UPPER)

DARTFORD

GB

DA1 2TW

GB

Emma Andrews
PADI Course Director and EFR Instructor Trainer #498751
Business Development Manager | Crystal Divers Mauritius
PADI 5 Star Career Development Centre

+230 5803 3263

emma@crystaldiversmu.com

www.crystaldiversmu.com

La Colline, Bala Street, Bain Boeuf

On Mon, 17 Oct 2022 at 12:22, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Tony


Please find your proforma invoice attached, our bank details are listed at the bottom of the invoice.


Please let me know once you have made the payment and if you have any questions.


Best regards
Ryan




Ryan Swaine
General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117




On Sun, 16 Oct 2022 at 15:17, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Tony Andrews <tony@crystaldiversmu.com>

Date: Sat, 15 Oct 2022 at 12:22

Subject: R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217) - Indian Ocean Water Sports order

To: <sales@vandagraph.co.uk>

Cc: Emma Andrews <emma@crystaldiversmu.com>





Good morning 


I am hoping you guys can help me to urgently order two of the following sensors 


R-17 Can Oxygen Sensor (0110217), i did email you guys about two weeks ago but i think i have
accidentally deleted the correspondence.


I would like to have them shipped to a UK address, so if you can supply us with payment details etc we are
happy to get this paid.


I look forward to hearing from you soon,


Regards,
Tony 

Anthony Andrews
PADI Course Director
Training Development Manager | Crystal Divers Mauritius
PADI 5 Star Instructor Development Centre

+230 5803 3266

tony@crystaldiversmu.com

www.crystaldiversmu.com

La Colline, Bala Street, Bain Boeuf
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