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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: OP-003035

1 message

F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com> 12 October 2022 at 17:00
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

In order to issue a P.I , please find below requested information.

Our shipping and billing  addresses  are as follow :

Fast Solutions for Trading

Rashad Center -Complex # 128,  Yajooz Str.

Jubeiha Amman P.O. Box: 1257, Jordan 11941

Tell : 0096265157327

Fax : 0096265156449

Cell:  00962796000501

Contact Person Murad Alotaibey

With respect to Payment method , we will  prefer Paybal , more quicker ( bank transfer will take more than three
Days) , so you can add %6 for Paypal process.

With respect to shipping charges ( please add Express courier charges Such as DHL, UPS, Fedex ).

The last request from you ( what is the expiry Date for this sensor)

 

Thanks,

 

 

 

 

Murad AlOtaibey

Operations Director

Fast Solutions for Trading

Rashad Center -Complex # 128,  Yajooz Str.

Jubeiha Amman P.O. Box: 1257, Jordan 11941

Tell : 0096265157327

Fax : 0096265156449

Cell:
 00962796000501

Email: sales@fastsolutions-me.com

SOS email: murad_a@hotmail.com

tel:0096265157327
tel:0096265157327
mailto:sales@fastsolutions-%1fme.com
mailto:murad_a@hotmail.com
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Web site: www.fastsolutions-me.com

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 12 October 2022 18:24

To: F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com>

Subject: Re: OP-003035

 

Hi Murad,

 

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, insurance and bank charges, I would need your
delivery and invoice addresses
in order to set up a new account for you, or I will wait for the official order you
mentioned.

 

We are unable to accept card payments.  We accept bank transfer or PayPal (this incurs a 6% fee of the total order).

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 12 Oct 2022 at 16:18, F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Can you accept prepaid cards, ( MasterCard’s) ??

 

Thanks,

 

 

Murad AlOtaibey

Operations Director

Fast Solutions for Trading

Rashad Center -Complex # 128,  Yajooz Str.

Jubeiha Amman P.O. Box: 1257, Jordan 11941

Tell : 0096265157327

Fax : 0096265156449

Cell:
 00962796000501

Email: sales@fastsolutions-me.com

SOS email: murad_a@hotmail.com

Web site: www.fastsolutions-me.com

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 12 October 2022 18:03

To: F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com>

Subject: Re: OP-003035

 

Hi Murad,

 

This sensor is currently in stock, but I cannot guarantee for how long of course!

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths
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Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue
to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email
kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter:
twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 12 Oct 2022 at 15:51, F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Please , Just advise lead time in order to submit an order.

 

Thanks,

 

 

Murad AlOtaibey

Operations Director

Fast Solutions for Trading

Rashad Center -Complex # 128,  Yajooz Str.

Jubeiha Amman P.O. Box: 1257, Jordan 11941
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Tell : 0096265157327

Fax : 0096265156449

Cell:
 00962796000501

Email: sales@fastsolutions-me.com

SOS email: murad_a@hotmail.com

Web site: www.fastsolutions-me.com

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 12 October 2022 17:21

To: F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com>

Subject: Re: OP-003035

 

Hi Murad,

 

Yes, we can ship to the UK, Europe or Jordan,

 

The price breaks in USD are as follows:

 

1 = $
187.85

2 = $ 169.07 each
EXW

3 -10 = $ 159.67 each
EXW

11 or more = $ 150.28 each
EXW

 

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, insurance and bank charges, I would need your
delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

 

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.

 

Many thanks.




Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue
to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email
kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter:
twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 12 Oct 2022 at 12:20, F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com> wrote:

Dear
Kate,

Can you supply this item to UK or Europe or Jordan ??

We have a collection point in Europe and UK , and we based  in Jordan.

The most important thing is availability or lead time , all other obstacles will be solved.

 

Best regards,

 

 

Murad AlOtaibey

Operations Director

Fast Solutions for Trading

Rashad Center -Complex # 128,  Yajooz Str.

Jubeiha Amman P.O. Box: 1257, Jordan 11941

Tell : 0096265157327

Fax : 0096265156449

Cell:
 00962796000501

Email: sales@fastsolutions-me.com
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SOS email: murad_a@hotmail.com

Web site: www.fastsolutions-me.com

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 12 October 2022 14:00

To: F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com>

Subject: Re: OP-003035

 

Good afternoon,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.

 

Unfortunately, we are unable to supply these to the USA, you would need to contact Teledyne directly.

 

I am sorry I have been unable to assist you further.




Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue
to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email
kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter:
twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 12 Oct 2022 at 11:57, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: F.S.T <sales@fastsolutions-me.com>

Date: Tue, 11 Oct 2022 at 18:25

Subject: OP-003035

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>

 

Dear Viamed Sales Team,

We are company based in Jordan,

Please advise if
UFO 130-2 Oxygen Sensor Part Number  0110081 is Available in Stock or advise lead
time.

Shipping address:

Fast Solutions

4283 Express Lane


Suite 5869-967 

Sarasota, FL 34249 

PH: (941) 538-6941

 

Best regards,

 

 

 

 

Murad AlOtaibey

Operations Director

Fast Solutions for Trading

Rashad Center -Complex # 128,  Yajooz Str.

Jubeiha Amman P.O. Box: 1257, Jordan 11941

Tell : 0096265157327

Fax : 0096265156449

Cell:
 00962796000501

Email: sales@fastsolutions-me.com

mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
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SOS email: murad_a@hotmail.com

Web site: www.fastsolutions-me.com

 

mailto:murad_a@hotmail.com
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