07/10/2022, 14:47 Gmail - FW: pulseoxymeter

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

FW: pulseoxymeter
1 message

Sandu Kishore <Kishore.Sandu@chuv.ch> 7 October 2022 at 11:34
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

Could you send me an official offer document to buy:
0012175 - Pulse Oximeter Viamed VM 2160, Veterinary is €379 each EXW + 0025010 lingual clip — small

Please address it to me:

Dr Kishore SANDU

LAUSANNE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL

SWITZERLAND

Looking forward to receiving it soon. This will then allow me to work on the payment for the device.
Thank you.

Sincerely
Dr Sandu

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------

From: alessandra.bergadano@unibe.ch

Date: 07/10/2022 12:26 (GMT+01:00)

To: Sandu Kishore <Kishore.Sandu@chuv.ch>, Courbon Cecile <Cecile.Courbon@chuv.ch>, Bichat Arnaud
<Arnaud.Bichat@chuv.ch>

Cc: michele.buerki@unibe.ch

Subject: FW: pulseoxymeter [HIN secured]

Dear Kishore

1) Please find below all the information required for ordering the pulse oximeter
0012175 - Pulse Oximeter Viamed VM 2160, Veterinary is €379 each EXW + 0025010 lingual clip — small
| think it easier if you place the order directly now.
2) Arnaud will order the anesthesia circuits (Intersurgical) ; | have checked with him the correct catalogue number

3) | have ordered 6 V-gels of 2 different sizes... will bring them with me when we come for the first surgery
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Kind regards

Alessandra

Alessandra Bergadano

PD, DVM, Dr.Med.Vet., Dip.ECVAA, Dip. ECLAM, PhD

Head of Experimental Animal Center (EAC), University of Bern
Murtenstrasse 35 CH-3008 Bern

Office: +41 31 632 87 49 Portable: +41 79 238 23 93

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Friday, 7 October 2022 10:59

To: Bergadano, Alessandra (EAC) <alessandra.bergadano@unibe.ch>

Subject: Re: pulseoxymeter

Good morning,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The price for part number 0012175 - Pulse Oximeter Viamed VM 2160, Veterinary is €379 each EXW. | have given the
price in euros, please let me know if you require the price in USD. This item is currently in stock.

Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, and insurance. If so, | would need your
delivery and invoice addresses in order to create an account for you.

The VM 2160 also includes a pulse oximetry sensor at no charge:
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1) 0015000 standard lingual clip sensor
or
2) 0015002 multi-site Y sensor.

If you choose option 2), then we also add one of the following at no charge:

a) 0025010 lingual clip - small
or

b) 0025011 lingual clip - medium
or

¢) 0025012 lingual clip - large

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Thu, 6 Oct 2022 at 14:30, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <alessandra.bergadano@unibe.ch>
Date: Thu, 6 Oct 2022 at 14:27

Subject: pulseoxymeter

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Hallo

We would be interested in purchasing one VM-2160 Hand Held Pulse Oximeter - Veterinary Pulse Oximeters Pulse
Oximetry 0012175

Would you be so kind to send me a quote and a potential delivery time?
Many thanks and kind regards

A Bergadano

Alessandra Bergadano

PD, DVM, Dr.Med.Vet., Dip.ECVAA, Dip. ECLAM, PhD

Head of Experimental Animal Center (EAC),

University of Bern Murtenstrasse 35 CH-3008 Bern

Office: +41 31 632 87 49 Portable: +41 79 238 23 93
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