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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: New order

1 message

operations@azmedicslebanon.com <operations@azmedicslebanon.com> 7 October 2022 at 07:43
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hello,

 

I need a quotation in Euro please with the freight cost and insurance.

 

Don’t forget to send me your bank euro account in order to transfer the money.

 

Regards,

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Wednesday, October 5, 2022 2:50 PM

To: AZMEDICS <operations@azmedicslebanon.com>

Subject: Re: New order

 

Hi,

 

Thank you for your reply.

 

I am only able to give you our current prices.  This is not something that will change.  When you decide which currency
you would like to use, I will be able to issue a proforma invoice.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 5 Oct 2022 at 09:51, AZMEDICS <operations@azmedicslebanon.com> wrote:

Good morning,

 

Sincerly the price in USD is more expensive than the Euro and specially that the euro is equivalent to USD. 

 

What we can do regarding this issue?

 

Thank you for your usual cooperation.

 

Regards

 

On Oct 5, 2022 11:45 AM, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning,

 

Before I create a proforma invoice, please could I ask whether you require it to be in euros or US dollars?  You
asked for prices in both currencies recently.  Your account is currently set up for USD.

 

Many thanks.




Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 5 Oct 2022 at 07:12, <operations@azmedicslebanon.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

 

I hope you are doing fine,

 

I’m resending you the order from this account to be more official.

 

1 – R-23Vi ( Qty : 45)

2- R-22MED ( Qty: 45)

3- R-41V ( Qty : 15)

4- R-26MED (Qty:15)

5- R-43V or equivalent least price ( Qty: 30)
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6- R-30V or equivalent least price ( Qty: 30)

7- T-7V or equivalent Least price ( Qty: 5)

8- R-48V or equivalent ( Qty:5)

 

I added some item and I changed quantities.

 

Regards

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Monday, May 23, 2022 1:28 PM

To: operations@azmedicslebanon.com

Subject: Re: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM136459-1

 

Good morning,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.

 

Unfortunately, we cannot offer a compatible, as the sensor is chipped so that only the originals will work.

 

I am sorry I have been unable to assist you on this occasion.

 

Many thanks.




Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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