06/10/2022, 14:15 Gmail - Fwd: R22-AHJR Sensor

M Gma" Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Fwd: R22-AHJR Sensor

1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 6 October 2022 at 14:01

Reply-To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
To: I7A Y¢E] <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>

Thank you for the update Tateishi

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: 3 ¥& <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>
Date: Thu, 6 Oct 2022 at 11:45

Subject: Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

To: <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Steve san

Thank you for contacting us. | was just thinking of contacting you.

| received a reminder from Nikon to confirm the delivery date.

Please use FedEx for transportation. Please let me know the invoice number as soon as possible.
thank you.

Regards
Tateishi

"Steve Nixon" ---2022/10/06 19:34:06---Hi Tateishi 100 sensors are tested and packed ready to go.

1£{S7T: "Steve Nixon" <office@viamed.co.uk>
BB5: tateishi@ichinen.co.jp

H{: 2022/10/06 19:34

{442 Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

1£{E7&: "Main Account" <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Hi Tateishi
100 sensors are tested and packed ready to go.
Can you please confirm how you want the sensors shipping UPS or FedEx?

The order says UPS but you usually use FedEx.

Steve

On Wed, 5 Oct 2022 at 11:41, <tateishi@jichinen.co.jp> wrote:

Stave san

Have 100 been shipped?
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1742504124659459790%7Cmsg-f%3A17459433...
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If not, please be sure to ship it within this week.
Please clarify when it will be shipped.
thank you.

Tateishi

HBST: tateishi@jichinen.co.jp

1X{S3: "Steve Nixon" <office@yviamed.co.uk>
B{J: 2022/10/05 04:05PM

1443 Re: R22-AHIJR Sensor

Sorry not yet Tateishi. I will let you know straight away.

Kind regards
Steve

On Tue, 4 Oct 2022 at 23:01, <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp> wrote:

> Dear Steve san

>

> Have you shipped 100 sensors?

> Please let me know the invoice number as soon as possible.
>

> thank you.

>

> Regards

> Tateishi

>

> [image: 5D AERTRZIET 7 T 1 712§ 530 FEE)---2022/10/03 18:27:37---Dear Steve san

> Thank you for your help.]3Zf F6&]---2022/10/03 18:27:37---Dear Steve san
> Thank you for your help. Thank you for contacting us. That would help a lot.
>

> X5 M A KE A T A
> HBS: steve.nixon@yiamed.co.uk
> H13: 2022/10/03 18:27

> {44%: Re: R22-AHJR Sensor
>

>
>

> Dear Steve san

>

> Thank you for your help.

> Thank you for contacting us. That would help a lot.
>

> Please send 100 as soon as possible.

> Please let me know the FedEx invoice number.

>

> Also, please send the remaining 108 items as soon as possible.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1742504124659459790%7Cmsg-f%3A17459433... 2/11
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>

> We also plan to order 100+ sensors soon.
>

> thank you.

>

> Regards

> Tateishi

>

>

> [image: FFADIERREIET 7 T 4 7129 %:"Steve Nixon" ---2022/09/30 22:57:05---Hi

> Tateishi It looks like you still hav]"Steve Nixon" ---2022/09/30
> 22:57:05---Hi Tateishi It looks like you still have the following back

> orders:
>

> 1E{ETT: "Steve Nixon" <office@yviamed.co.uk>

> BBSC: tateishi@ichinen.co.jp

> B{: 2022/09/30 22:57

> {44%: Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

> 1X{S&: "Main Account" <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
>
>
>
>

> Hi Tateishi
>

> It looks like you still have the following back orders:

>

>20220614002VIAMED 100 sensors

> 20220620001 VIAMED 8 sensors remaining on this order

> 20220831001 VIAMED 100 sensors

>

> I ordered more, so as long as the full allocations are delivered we will

> have enough to cover you back orders, even if some do not pass QA. We
> should also have extra sensors in reserve.

>

> I suggest we ship a minimum of 100. I will update you on Monday/Tuesday.
>

> Will 208 cover your current requirements?

>

>

> Steve

>

>

> On Fri1, 30 Sept 2022 at 14:29, <*tateishi@jichinen.co.jp*

> <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>> wrote:
>

Stave san

I'm glad. relieved.
Please send me the ones that pass the test as soon as possible. Please.

How many pieces in one batch? After a week, we need 70 pieces.
I want you to continue to send it.

Tateishi

VVVVVVYVYVVYV
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----- {ERZ: "Steve Nixon" <*office@yviamed.co.uk* <office@yiamed.co.uk>>

HBST: *tateishi@jichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@jichinen.co.jp>

1E{=3&: "Steve Nixon" <*office@viamed.co.uk* <office@yviamed.co.uk>>
H1F: 2022/09/30 07:48PM

{44Z: Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

Dear Tateishi

Good timing, I have just had notification that two batches will be
shipped

to us tomorrow. | have already discussed with our QA/shipping to make
the

processing of 70 sensors for you as the first priority.

Steve

On Fri, 30 Sept 2022 at 11:23, <*tateishi@jichinen.co.jp*
<tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>> wrote:

> Dear Steve san
>

> Thank you for your help.

>

> Have you decided on your next delivery? I would like to know the
schedule.

> If we do not receive more than 70 sensors by 10/7 (Friday), the
delivery

> will be delayed again and we will becomes a compensation issue.
> Anyway, please deliver as soon as possible.

> Please.
>

> Regard's
> Tateishi
>

>

> [image: 5¥AADIERRZIET 7 7 14 719 5 :"Steve Nixon" ---2022/09/21 19:04:43---Hi

> Tateishi Thank you for your condolen]"Steve Nixon" ---2022/09/21

> 19:04:43---Hi Tateishi Thank you for your condolences regarding Queen
> Elizabeth II. I'm out of the

>

> J£{=7T: "Steve Nixon" <*office(@yiamed.co.uk* <office(@yviamed.co.uk>>

> BBST: "M A YEE]" <*tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@jichinen.co.jp>>

> H{J: 2022/09/21 19:04

> {443 Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

> 1X{S&: "Main Account" <*viamedinbox@gmail.com* <viamedinbox@gmail.com>>
>
>
>
>
> Hi Tateishi
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>

> Thank you for your condolences regarding Queen Elizabeth II. I'm out
of

> the office, but I am chasing up regarding your orders and I will get
back

> to you.

>

> Steve

>

> On Tue, 20 Sept 2022, 15:34 , <**tateishi@ichinen.co.jp*
<tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>*

> <*tateishi(@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@jichinen.co.jp>>> wrote:

>

Dear Steve san

Were you able to produce the R22-AHJR sensor?

When can you ship this to us?

We are receiving a lot of orders from Nikon, so please ship them
immediately.

Elizabeth II died. Rest in peace.

Regards
Tateishi

"Steve Nixon" ---2022/09/07 05:29:01---Sorry Tateishi It was worth
trying, but only two have come back into specification. I have

V VVVVVVVYVYVVYVYVYVYVYV

1X(=7T: "Steve Nixon" <**office(@yiamed.co.uk* <office(@yviamed.co.uk>*
<*office@yviamed.co.uk* <office@yviamed.co.uk>>>

> BB "I A FEF]" <**tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>* <
*tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>>>

> H{F: 2022/09/07 05:29

> {44%: Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

> 1X{S&: "Main Account" <**viamedinbox@gmail.com*
<viamedinbox@gmail.com>* <*viamedinbox(@gmail.com*
<viamedinbox@gmail.com>>>

Sorry Tateishi

VVVYVYVVYV

It was worth trying, but only two have come back into
specification. I

> have asked production to try and get more sensors completed as
soon as

possible.

>
>

>

> Steve
>

> On Tue, 6 Sept 2022 at 12:24, 3747 F&E] <**tateishi@jichinen.co.jp*
<tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>*

> <*tateishi@jichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>>> wrote:

> Dear Steve san
>
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> Thank you for your help.

>

> T haven't received the test results yet. How many did you pass?
> [ would be happy if 26 passed, but how many did you get?
>

> Please send us the passed sensor immediately. Please.

>

> Regards

> Tateishi

>

> "Steve Nixon" ---2022/09/02 00:44:39---Dear Tateishi I will
provide an

> update tomorrow.

>

> JX{S7T: "Steve Nixon" <**office@yviamed.co.uk* <office@yiamed.co.uk>*
<*office@yviamed.co.uk* <office@yviamed.co.uk>>>

> BB "M A FEE]" <**tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>* <
*tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>>>

> H{F: 2022/09/02 00:44

> {4%%: Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

> 1X{F&: "Main Account" <**viamedinbox@gmail.com*
<viamedinbox(@gmail.com>* <*viamedinbox(@gmail.com*
<viamedinbox@gmail.com>>>

Dear Tateishi

I will provide an update tomorrow.

Regards

Steve

V VVVVVVVVYVVYVYVYV

On Thu, 1 Sept 2022 at 12:37, 3743 Y¢&) <**tateishi@ichinen.co.jp*
<tateishi@jichinen.co.jp>*

> <*tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>>> wrote:
> Dear Steve san

>

> Thank you for your reply. Thank you for your cooperation.

>

> T look forward to the test results. How many did you pass?

>

> If you have passed the test, please send it immediately.

>

> Regards

> Tateishi

>

> "Steve Nixon" ---2022/09/01 06:54:56---Dear Tateishi If we had
them,

> of course I would send them straight away.

>

> JX(S7T: "Steve Nixon" <**office@yviamed.co.uk* <office@yiamed.co.uk>*
<*office@yviamed.co.uk* <office@yiamed.co.uk>>>
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> BE4G: "I A YEE]" <**tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>* <
*tateishi@jichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>>>

> B 2022/09/01 06:54

> {443: Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

> JX(SZ&: "Main Account" <**viamedinbox@gmail.com*
<viamedinbox@gmail.com>* <*viamedinbox(@gmail.com*
<viamedinbox@gmail.com>>>

>
>

>

>

> Dear Tateishi

>

> If we had them, of course I would send them straight away.

>

> The only ones we have are 34 that did not pass our QA testing. I
will

> get these tested again tomorrow, just in case they have now
fallen into

> specification.

>

>

> Regards

>

> Steve

>

> On Wed, 31 Aug 2022 at 13:33, 3 J¢&] <**tateishi@ichinen.co.jp*

<tateishi@jichinen.co.jp>*

> <*tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@jichinen.co.jp>>> wrote:
> Dear Steve san

>

> Ireceived your email.

> Do you have R22-AHJR in stock? Even if it's just 26, I want it
right

> away.

>

> Thank you for your cooperation.

>

> Kind regards

> Tateishi

>

> "Steve Nixon" ---2022/08/29 22:57:18---Dear Tateishi I am trying
to

> get production completed earlier. Unfortunately at

>

>  JX{S7T: "Steve Nixon" <**office@yviamed.co.uk* <office@yiamed.co.uk>*
<*office@yviamed.co.uk* <office@yiamed.co.uk>>>

> PB4 **tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>* <
*tateishi@jichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>>

> H{7:2022/08/29 22:57

> {4%%: Re: R22-AHJR Sensor

> JX(SF&: "Main Account" <**yiamedinbox@gmail.com*
<viamedinbox@gmail.com>* <*viamedinbox@gmail.com*
<viamedinbox@gmail.com>>>

>
>
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> >
>
> Dear Tateishi
>
> I am trying to get production completed earlier. Unfortunately at
> the moment it is scheduled to complete by the 2nd / 3rd week of
September.
>
>
> Kind regards
>
> Steve
>
> On Wed, 24 Aug 2022 at 10:43, <**tateishi@ichinen.co.jp*

<tateishi@ichinen.co.jp>*

VVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVYVYVVYVYVYV
VVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVVYVYVVYVYVYV

>
>

V

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1742504124659459790%7Cmsg-f%3A17459433...

> <*tateishi@ichinen.co.jp* <tateishi@jichinen.co.jp>>> wrote:
> Dear Steve san

>

> It has been a while.

> The delay in delivery to Nikon is also expected to be resolved at
the

> end of August.

> Thank you for your cooperation.

>

> In the future, we will be asked to manage the delivery so that
there

will be no delays in delivery to Nikon.
Thank you for your continued cooperation.

Now, when is the delivery date for the backordered 108 pieces?
PO#20220620001: 8 pieces
PO#20220614002: 100 pieces

A minimum of 26 sensors is required by September 9th.
Please send it out.

thank you.

Regards
Tateishi

Steve
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at **www.viamed.co.uk/policy**
<http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy*>
<*http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy* <http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy>
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Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at **www.viamed.co.uk/policy**

<http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy*>
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Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at **www.viamed.co.uk/policy**

<http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy*>
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Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at **www.viamed.co.uk/policy**

<http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy*>

>
>
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Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at *www.viamed.co.uk/policy™*
<http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy>
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> -

> Steve

>

>

> Steve Nixon

> Director - Viamed Ltd.

>

> Office: +44 (0)1535 634542

> Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

>

>

> GDPR / Privacy Policy available at *www.viamed.co.uk/policy™*
> <http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy>
>

>

>

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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Steve

Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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